

BID TABULATION SHEET, 11-13-12, 11:00 AM

ORIGINAL

DEPARTMENT: WILL COUNTY ADULT & JUVENILE DETENTION FACILITIES
BID #2013-15 MEDICAL SERVICES
BID DUE: 11-13-12, 11:00 AM **OPEN:** 11-13-12, 11:10 AM

COMPANY NAME	BID DOCUMENTS	PRICING PERIOD	ADF ANNUAL COST	RVJC ANNUAL COST
Annashae Corp. 673 Alpha Drive Cleveland, Ohio 44141	Bond - Prime - Ref - Addendum - 1 Form -	YR ONE YR TWO YR THREE GRAND TOTAL	<i>NO BID</i>	<i>REC'D</i>
Correct Care Solutions 1283 Murfreesboro Rd., Ste 500 Nashville, TN 37217	Bond - 16% Prime - <i>YES</i> Ref - <i>YES</i> Addendum - ① Form - <i>YES/YES</i>	YR ONE YR TWO YR THREE GRAND TOTAL	\$ 3,849,870.00 \$ 3,974,991.00 \$ 4,104,178.00 \$ 11,929,040.00	\$ 449,220.00 \$ 463,819.00 \$ 478,893.00 \$ 1,391,932.00
Wexford Health Sources, Inc. 425 Holiday Drive Foster Plaza Two Pittsburgh, PA 15220	Bond - Prime - Ref - Addendum - 1 Form -	YR ONE YR TWO YR THREE GRAND TOTAL	<i>NO BID</i>	<i>REC'D</i>
Correctional Healthcare Companies CHC 6200 S. Syracuse Way #440 Greenwood Village, CO 80111 <i>John Gordin</i>	Bond - 10% Prime - <i>Yes</i> Ref - <i>Yes</i> Addendum - ① Form <i>yes/yes</i>	YR ONE YR TWO YR THREE GRAND TOTAL	\$3,427,497.61 \$3,571,331.67 \$3,720,966.02 \$10,719,795.29	\$437,159.92 \$449,774.72 \$462,767.94 \$1,349,702.60
ADVANCED Correctional Healthcare 3922 W. Baring Trace Peoria, IL 61615-2500	Bond - Prime - Ref - Addendum - 1 Form -	YR ONE YR TWO YR THREE GRAND TOTAL	<i>NO BID</i>	<i>REC'D</i>
NaphCare, Inc. 2090 Columbiana Road, Suite 4000 Birmingham, AL 35216	Bond - 10% Prime - <i>Yes</i> Ref - <i>Yes</i> Addendum - ① Form <i>YES/YES</i>	YR ONE YR TWO YR THREE GRAND TOTAL	\$ 3,943,021.18 \$ 4,141,465.80 \$ 4,347,848.21 \$ 12,432,335.19	\$ 646,022.18 \$ 671,863.07 \$ 698,737.59 \$ 2,016,622.84
Correctional Medical Care, Inc. (CMC) 920 Harvest Drive Suite 120 Blue Bell, PA 19422	Bond - Prime - Ref - Addendum - 1 Form -	YR ONE YR TWO YR THREE GRAND TOTAL	<i>NO BID</i>	<i>REC'D</i>

ALSO PRESENT

- MO* Michael O'Leary, Warden, WCADF, *sm* Gina Marotta, Deputy Chief Support Services, WCADF
- JP* John Prinzi, Superintendent, RVJDC, *df* Toni Johnson, Operations Manager, RVJDC
- PM* Terre Marshall, Consultant
- PR* Paul Rafac, Finance Director
- EW* Rita Weiss, Purchasing Director, *MS* Missy Miesmer Fort, Purchasing Assistant