



OFFICE OF WILL COUNTY EXECUTIVE
LAWRENCE M. WALSH

Rita Weiss
Purchasing Director

(815) 740-4605
Fax (815) 740-4604
rweiss@willcountyillinois.com

**2013-24 HOUSEHOLD HAZARDOUS WASTE COLLECTION PROGRAM
FOR THE COUNTY OF WILL**

**ADDENDUM #1
March 19, 2013**

Page 1 of 2

Question #1: Page 6 of Attachment E shows a disposal cost sheet listing various types of cylinders to be priced in different types of shipping containers (30s, 55s, CYBs). It is industry standard to price these items by cylinder. Can bidders price the units of measure they will be shipping and invoicing the waste in, filling the remaining spaces in the disposal cost sheet with the term "Not Applicable" or "NA"?

Answer #1: If bidder does not provide pricing for a waste stream in a specific manner listed then "No Bid" should be placed within that designated box(s). For example, if bidder does not provide pricing for propane cylinders loose packed in drums or cubic yard boxes then "No Bid" should be stated in those designated boxes.

Question #2: Page 6 of Attachment E shows a disposal cost sheet listing various medical wastes to be priced in different types of shipping containers (30s, 55s). If collected this waste will be packaged in one standard container type. Can bidders price the units of measure they will be shipping and invoicing the waste in, filling the remaining spaces in the disposal cost sheet with the term "Not Applicable" or "NA"?

Answer #2: If bidder does not provide pricing, packaging, and/or transportation for a waste stream in a specific manner then "No Bid" should be placed within that designated box(s). For example, if bidder does not provide pricing, packaging, or transportation for medical waste in a particular sized shipping container then "No Bid" should be stated in that designated box. If bidder provides pricing, packaging, and disposal for medical wastes using a shipping container other than those listed on Page 6 of Attachment E then utilize Page 5 of Attachment E to specify bidder's container type used then fill out remaining boxes for that waste stream.

Question #3: Page 4 of Attachment E shows a disposal cost sheet listing various light bulb types to be priced in different types of shipping containers (30s, 55s) as well as per pound and each. It is industry standard to price these items per pound or each with a minimum charge per container (box). Can bidders price the units of measure they will be shipping and invoicing the waste in, filling the remaining spaces in the disposal cost sheet with the term "Not Applicable" or "NA"?

Answer #3: If bidder does not provide pricing, packaging, and/or transportation for a waste stream in a specific manner then "No Bid" should be placed within that designated box(s). For example, if bidder does not provide pricing for Halide bulbs per drum then "No Bid" should be stated in the designated boxes for the drum columns.

**2013-24 HOUSEHOLD HAZARDOUS WASTE COLLECTION PROGRAM
FOR THE COUNTY OF WILL**

**ADDENDUM #1
March 19, 2013**

Page 2 of 2

Question #4: Pages 1-2 of Attachment E shows a disposal cost sheet listing various waste streams to be priced in different types of shipping containers (30s, 55s, etc). Some of the waste streams cannot be packaged in the container types listed, for example, bulked flammable liquids in Cubic Yard Boxes. Can bidders to only price the container types and sizes they will be shipping and invoicing the waste in, filling the remaining spaces in the disposal cost sheet with the term "Not Applicable" or "NA"?

Answer #4: If bidder does not provide pricing, packaging, and/or transportation for a waste stream in a specific manner then "No Bid" should be placed within that designated box(s). For example, if bidder does not provide pricing, packaging, and/or transportation of lithium batteries in cubic yard boxes, then "No Bid" should be placed in that designated box.

In regards to the "Flammable Liquid, bulked" waste stream, "NA" should be placed in the cubic yard box.

Question #5: May we get the Disposal costs from the previous bid?

Answer #5: Attached are the disposal cost sheet Attachment E and mobilization cost sheet Attachment G, from awarded vendor from previous bid.

**ATTACHMENT E
DISPOSAL COST SHEET**

- The disposal cost sheet must be completed in its entirety. The disposal cost sheet below **must be completed** for unit cost per 55-gallon drums.
- Cost for use by Contractor of other size drums shall be pro-rated based on cost of 55-gallon drum (i.e. 5/55, 15/55, 30/55, 85/55, etc.).
- Cost for use by Contractor of cubic yard boxes shall be equal to the cost of four 55-gallon drums.
- If additional waste management methods are available or preferred for a waste stream please indicate those on disposal cost sheet below waste stream or on additional table provided. Place an "X" next to waste management method preferred by vendor.
- If minimums are required, please indicate on this cost sheet.
- Any and all exceptions to these specifications must be clearly and completely indicated on this cost sheet.
- For Preferred Contractor Packaging Method for waste stream use the following: Bulked, Labpacked, or CP (for "in consumer packaging"). If Contractor prefers other packaging method please specify clearly within Preferred Contractor Packaging Method column.
- Gray scaled/shaded boxes are to remain empty.

Waste Stream & Waste Management Method (Mark with "X" next to preferred Vendor Method for Waste Management)	Minimum Container Cost	Unit Cost (55-gallon drums)	Preferred Contractor Packaging Method	Designated Facility
Aerosols, Flammable:				All material will be manifested direct to PCI's Part B RCRA permitted TSDF in East Chicago, IN. The majority of the waste will be processed here. Below the final facility is identified.
-Fuel Blended X	0	\$140.00	Loosepack	CRI Environment, Inc.
-Recycled	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
Other:	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
Aerosols, Poisons:				
-Incinerated X	0	\$175.00	Loosepack (foamers fix a flat)	Clean Harbors
Other:	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
Asbestos:				
- Landfilled X	0	\$60.00	Loosepack	Pollution Control Industries
Asbestos-Roofing Tar Liquids:				
- Landfilled X	0	\$60.00	Loosepack	Riverbend Prairie Landfill
Batteries, Alkaline:				
- Recycled X	0	\$296.00	30gal Loosepack	INMETCO
Batteries, Lithium:				
- Recycled X	0	\$45.00	5 gal loosepack (terminals taped)	INMETCO
Batteries, Mercury:				
- Recycled X	0	\$45.00	5 gal loosepack (terminals taped)	INMETCO
Batteries, Nickel-Cadmium:				
-Recycled X	0	\$160.00	Loosepack	INMETCO
Batteries, Other Rechargeable:				
-Recycled X	0	\$45.00	5 gal loosepack (terminals taped)	INMETCO
Corrosives:				
Treated X	0	\$140.00	Loosepack	Pollution Control Industries
Incinerated	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
Other:	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A

Waste Stream & Waste Management Method (Mark with "X" next to preferred Vendor Method for Waste Management)	Minimum Container Cost	Unit Cost (55-gallon drums)	Preferred Contractor Packaging Method	Designated Facility
Environmentally Hazardous Substance, n.o.s.:				
- Treated	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
- Incinerated X	0	\$156.00	Loosepack	Ross Incineration
Other:	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
Flammable Liquids, bulked:				
- Fuel Blended X	0	\$71.00	Bulk (no sludge or paint)	Pollution Control Industries
- Incinerated	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
Other:	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
Flammable Liquids, not suitable for bulking:				
- Fuel Blended X	0	\$170.00	Loosepack	Pollution Control Industries
- Incinerated	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
Other:	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
Flammable Liquids, Toxic:				
- Incinerated X		\$170.00	Loosepack	Ross
Other:	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
Mercury/Mercury Containing Items:				
- Recycled X	0	\$170.00	5gal Loosepack	Mercury Waste Solutions
Other:	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
Organic Peroxide Liquids:				
Incinerated X	0	\$160.00	5 gal Labpack	Clean Harbors
Other:	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
Oxidizers:				
Treated X	0	\$320.00	Loosepack	Pollution Control Industries
Incinerated	0	\$345.00	Loosepack	Clean Harbors
Other:	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
Oil Filters				
Recycled X	0	\$89.00	Loosepack	Pollution Control Industries
Other:	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
PCB Capacitors, Ballasts, & Transformers:				
Incinerated	0	\$385.00	Loosepack	Veolia
Other: Recycle X	0	\$295.00	Loosepack (PCB Ballasts only)	Veolia
PCB Contaminated Liquids:				
Incinerated X	0	\$385	Bulk (non RCRA PCB oil)	Veolia
Other:	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
Toxic Liquids, inorganic n.o.s.:				
Incinerated X	0	\$140.00	Loosepack	Ross
Other:	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A

**ATTACHMENT E (Continued)
DISPOSAL COST SHEET**

Waste Stream & Waste Management Method (Mark with "X" next to preferred Vendor Method for Waste Management)	Minimum Container Cost	Unit Cost (55-gallon drums)	Preferred Contractor Packaging Method	Designated Facility
Toxic Liquid: Penta-Reactive:				
Incinerated X	0	\$255.00	Loosepack	Clean Harbors
Other:	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
Toxic Solids:				
Incinerated X	0	\$199.00	Loosepack	Ross
Other:	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
Water Reactive:				
-Incinerated X	0	\$150.00	Loosepack (5gallon limit)	Clean Harbors
Other:	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A

Waste Stream & Waste Management Method	Preferred Vendor Method for Waste Management ("X")	Minimum Container Cost	Unit Cost (55-gallon drums)	Unit Cost (per gallon)	Designated Facility
Antifreeze:					
-Bulked in Drums & Recycled	X	0	\$70.00		Consolidated Recycling
-Bulked in Truck & Recycled	--	0		\$.43 (minimum of 2,000 gallons)	Consolidated Recycling
Other:	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
Waste Oils:					
-Bulked in Drums & Burned for Fuels or Recycled	X	0	\$50.00		Future Environmental
-Bulked in Truck & Burned for Fuels or Recycled	--	0		\$.43 (minimum of 2,000 gallons)	Future Environmental
Other:	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A

**ATTACHMENT E (Continued)
DISPOSAL COST SHEET**

Indicate Minimum container fees in Parentheses () within Unit Cost columns

Waste Stream & Waste Management Method	Vendor Preferred Method (Mark "X")	Unit Cost (55-gallon drums)	Unit Cost (20 cubic yard dumpster)	Unit Cost (30 cubic yard dumpster)	Designated Facility
Latex Paints:					
-Bulked & Recycled	--	\$185.00			Amazon
-Bulked & Burned for Fuels	--	\$120.00			Covanta
-Loose packed in consumer packaging with oil based paint & burned for fuels	--	\$123.75	\$2,875.00	\$2,875.00	Covanta
-Loose packed in consumer packaging and recycled	X (Roll Off)	\$120.00	\$2,500.00	\$2,500.00	Covanta
Other: Solidification & Landfill	--	\$90.00	\$1,600.00	\$1,600.00	Riverbend Prairie
Oil-Based Paints:					
-Bulked & Recycled	N/A	N/A			N/A
-Bulked & Burned for Fuels	--	\$99.00			Pollution Control Industries
-Loose packed in consumer packaging & burned for fuels	X (Cubic Yard Box)	\$135.00 (\$410/cubic yard box)	\$3,600.00	\$3,600.00	Pollution Control Industries
Other:					

Waste & Waste Management Method	Unit Cost (per bulb)	Designated Facility
Fluorescent Bulbs/Lamps - Recycled:		
4 foot bulbs	\$0.38	Waste Management
8 foot bulbs	\$0.49	Waste Management
U-shaped bulbs	\$0.44	Waste Management
Compact Fluorescent Bulbs	\$0.44	Waste Management
HID Bulbs	\$0.90	Waste Management

**ATTACHMENT E (Continued)
DISPOSAL COST SHEET**

Listed below are materials typically considered as 'unacceptable' household hazardous waste. Please complete the waste categories, which are applicable to your company's service. If unable to accept a waste indicate as "No Bid". A blank waste category will be considered no cost for disposal. Gray scaled/shaded cells are to remain blank.

Waste	Unit Cost (Per Cylinder/Canister)	Disposal Facility
Compressed Gas:		
-16.4 ounce single use Propane canister (for camp stoves) Recycled/Reuse	\$10.00	IES
-14.1 ounce single use cylinder containing propane/MAPP gas/others (for small torch work) Recycled/Reuse	\$14.00	IES
-20 pound Propane cyl Recycled/Reuse	\$30.00	IES
-40 pound Propane cyl Recycled/Reuse	\$30.00	IES

Waste	Vendor Preferred Unit for Cost	Unit Cost	Disposal Facility
Lead Acid Batteries Recycled	Per Pound	\$0.35	Exide Technologies

Waste	Unit Cost (55-gallon drums)	Waste Management Method	Disposal Facility
Agricultural Chemicals and Fertilizers:			
-solid	\$199.00	Incineration/Stabilization	Ross Incineration
-liquid	\$199.00	Fuel Blend/Incineration	Ross Incineration
Medical Waste:			
-Sharps/needles	\$145.00	Autoclave/Stabilization	Ampro
-old/unused medication	\$156.00	Incineration	Ross Incineration
Smoke/fire/radon detectors	Unable to accept radioactives	Unable to accept radioactives	Unable to accept radioactives

ATTACHMENT G
MOBILIZATION AND DRUM DELIVERY AND PICKUP COST SHEET
For Mobile HHW Collections and Drum Delivery and Pickups

Mobilization Cost for Mobile HHW Collections ^a	Unit Price
Including all labor, material, and equipment necessary to plan, manage, and operate a HHW mobile collection event based on a participation of 500 vehicles.	\$3,855.00
Incremental price increase in mobilization costs to account for an increase in increments of each 1% of vehicles above 500 vehicles. ^b	\$49.00
Incremental price decrease in mobilization costs to account for a decrease in increments of each 1% of vehicles below 500 vehicles. ^c	\$30.00
Minimum mobilization Cost	\$0.00

Drum Delivery and Pickup Costs ^a	Unit Price
Including all labor, supplies, and equipment to conduct a drop off of fifteen empty drums and pickup fifteen full drums from County warehouse located at 806 Nicholson St., Joliet, Illinois 60435.	\$495.00

Notes:

- a. Any and all exceptions to these specifications must be clearly and completely indicated on the bid sheet.
- b. Bid in increments of 1% above 500 vehicles. For invoice purposes the following formula example should be used in the case of an increase in participation above 500 vehicles.
 Example: Actual number of vehicles at example event = 560 vehicles
 Unit Price designated by CONTRACTOR for increase in vehicles for each 1% above 500 = \$25

$$560 \text{ vehicles} - 500 \text{ vehicles} = 60 \text{ vehicles} / 500 \text{ vehicles} = .12 \times 100 = 12(\%) \times \$25 = \$300 \text{ increase in mobilization costs.}$$
- c. Bid in increments of 1% below 500 vehicles. For invoice purposes the following formula example should be used in the case of a decrease in participation below 500 vehicles.
 Example: Actual number of vehicles at example event = 457 vehicles
 Unit Price designated by CONTRACTOR for decrease in vehicles for each 1% below 500 = \$25

$$500 \text{ vehicles} - 457 \text{ vehicles} = 43 \text{ vehicles} / 500 \text{ vehicles} = 0.086 \times 100 = 8.6(\%) \times \$25 = \$215 \text{ decrease in mobilization costs.}$$