OFFICE OF WILL COUNTY EXECUTIVE
LAWRENCE M. WALSH

Will County Office Building — 302 N Chicago Street — Joliet, Illinois 60432

{815) 740-4605
Fax (815) 740-4804
rweiss@willcountyillinois.com

Rita Weiss
Purchasing Director

2016-24 HOUSEHOLD HAZARDOUS WASTE COLLECTION PROGRAM
FOR THE COUNTY OF WILL

ADDENDUM 1
March 22, 2016

Question #1: What process and who would | contact from a FOIA request on the bidder pricing and

awarded vendor from tast RFP? Please advise.

Answer #1: Attached are the disposal cost sheet Attachment E and mobilization cost sheet Attachment
G, from awarded vendor from previous bid, as well as resolution for award of bid.



Execufive Committes
" Resolution #13-107

. RESOLUTION OF THE COUNTY BOARD
WILL GOUNTY, ILLINOIS

Awardmg Bid for Hnuseho&d Hazardous Wast@ Cu&iect;on

WHEREAS t#ie IHinois Solid Waste Planning and Recycling Act mandates colnties to pian for the

- {iﬁanagement of solid waste; and

o WHEREAS ‘the: COUNTY has adopted ‘the thlrd ﬁve»year update of tha “Wln County Sol:d Waste‘
* Management Plan”, on November 20, 2008; and

CWHEREAS, in keepmg with the County's’ Solid Waste Plan will County vl prov;de opt{ons to the -

| 'pubtsc for the safe collection and appropriate management and disposal of Household Hazardous Waste .

- | when funding is available and in response fo program needs; and

WHEREAS Waste' Management, Inc. pursuant fo -the “Host Agreement and’ Agreement for

' “---'Operatlon!Development of the Will County Landfil’ will pay for two household hazardous waste . .

ccllecﬂons per year each spring for the [ife of the landfill; and

o - WHEREAS, Bn March 26, 2013, thé County Executwas Off ice opened four acceptable blds to .

,'prcwlda household hazardous waste collection services, for approximately five household hazardous
waste collections per yearand as needed pharmacautical waste pickup from the County Warehouse and
. as needed paint coilection supphes drop off or paint pickup at county partner sites for a three year period;
and o

- WHEREAS the Resource Recovery & Enefgy DiVISan staﬁ has recommended and the Executwe' g
_‘Commnttee soncurs, that the bid for household hazardous waste collection services be awarded to the
" lowest responsible and responsive bidder, Tradebe Treafment & Recycling, East Chicago, IN; and all

- eosts associated with this agreement will be paid from the Scfid Waste Management fund.

" ending April 30, 2016.

B NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, that the Will County Board hereby awards the agreement '
for _the household hazardous waste collection services o the lowest responsible and responsive bidder,
Tradebe Treatment & Recycling, East Chicago, IN for a three year period, starting May 1, 2013 and

" BE T FURTH ER RESOLVED that the Preamble of this Resoluhon is hereby adopied as if fuiiy set“
_ “heréin: This Resolution shall be in full force and effect upon its passage and approval as provided by law.

- Adopted by the Wil County Board this 18™ day of April, 2013,

- ‘\lote Yes. 24 No .0 Pass (SEAL) ‘ y
. ‘ ;; chultz Voots
unty Clerk

:Apbrove& this; 26 dayof iApril - . 2013 A4 .
: Lawrence M. Walsh
Wil County Executive

i

. Res awarding bid hausehold hazardous waste collection HHW 18Apr13




Exécutive Committés
Resoiution #13-107 -
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FROM THE DESK OF

RITA WEISS
 FURCHASING DIRECTOR
. BEB HISTORY ke
mEMs ao-: %24 HOUSEHOLE HAZARDOUS WASTE COLLEGTION BB

g :';aEPARTMENY* . LAND USE, WASTE SERVICES DIVISION

e EXECUTIVE PERMISSION TO BID: WA BUDGETED fEM
7 FINA - N/A BUDGETED ITEM

B @ MARCH 8, 2013 T
- PUBLISHED Hbﬂﬂ’&l‘ . HERALD NEWS, JOL%ET MARCN& 2013

" FUNDING SOURCE; * | #85-41-280-3910 Racycling Program .
U BIDOPEMING . MARCHZ26,2013,10:40AM. .
LOCATION: - WILL COUNTY OFFICE BUILDING
: . 302 N. CHICAGO ST,
- JOLIET, IL. 60432 R
. NUMBERRELEASED: 124 INTERNET NUMBER RETURNED; ~ 5
CopmpER: 0 .. - . TOTALFORONEEVENT"
. Tradebs Trastmoint & Recyeling, East Chicags, N~ . $20,384.80
' Veplia Environmentzl! Saervices, East Chicago, IN S8 21,086.85
" EQ - The Environmental Quality Co, Wayne, Ml .~ . $32,116.05
Heritage Envirtonmental Servicas, LLC, Lemont, i . - % 37,506.50
~ Clean Harbors Environmental Services, Chicago, I~ - NOBID

- -Recommendation from Dean Olaon, Resource Rscovery & Energy f)iv!sian Dtrector

" and David Hartks, Household Hazardous Waste Program Managsr, is 1o selact lowest, .~

- regponsible bidder, Tradsbe Treatment & Recveiing, East Chicago, I, for the .
' - approximate cost of § 26,389.80 per evant. This will be a threa (3 year contract, from

. May 1, 2013 through April 30, 20186.




' BID TABULATION SHEET

Exécutive Corhmitiee ..
- Resolution #13-107

Attachment i-Page 20f 5
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' DEPARTMENT: BID #2013-24 HHW COLLECTION, WASTE SERVICES DEPARTMENT

. "‘DUE: 3-28-13, 16:00 AR

OPENED: 3-28-13, 10:10 AM

BISOER

. REQUIREMENTS

ATTACHMENTS

4343 Kennedy Avenua - . -

| ] Tradebs Treatment & Racycling

" 7| Bast Chicaga, IN 46312

BID RONSF S~ Bemndh

| PrivE cERY TN e

ADDENDA REG G | Ugd

FORMS SIGNED Wb~ - o

| EQ ~ The Environmental Quallty Co
7 | 36255 Michigan Avenusg -
| Wayne, Mi 48184

BID BOND 5000~ Dendt

| PRIME CERTOEN -
| acoENpARECD I
FORWS SIGNED s, -~

| Clean Harbors Environmental Sves
7] 11800 South Stony lsiand Avenua -
‘| Chikiago, il 80837 .

| prmEcERY
' ADDENDA RES'D

BiD BOND

FORMES SIGNED

NosiD

" Lemont, 1L 0430

§ Haritage Environmental Services LLE
15330 Canal Bank Road

iy

BID BOND & %ret— Rag
| PRIME GERY W o

ADDENDA REC'D \ vgim

FORMS SIGNED\s, .

" { Veolia ES Technical Solutions
5137 Indianapolis Boulevard

| East Chicago, IN 48312 . .

BID BOND 873000 -~ Rund
PRIME CERT ey~
ADBENDA REC'D \ (g2
Fomessmwmv@ |

TomMagRy» ZTauuODy za;umomb. FOMARE > x@%momh
e el i, Sl : W B B £LE

7 ALSO PRESENT: R!@lss, Missy Wiesmer Fort, David Hastke o
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Executive Comimittee
Resolution #13-107
- Attachment 1-Page 3of §

- o WILL COUNTY LAND USE DEPARTMENT
Resource Recovery & Bnsvgy Division
Ny 58 B. Clinton Sireet
Joliet, Minois 60432

7 TO: | Will County Hxecutivé Cominittee

" FROM:-" i Dean Olson, Resource Recavery & Brergy Divisiofi Direétor -
o ! Dave Hartke, Houschold Hazardous Waste Program Manager

RE: - . Recommendation of Household Hazardous Waste Contractor = |

I zeéegin' with ihe Will County Solid Waste Management Plis appioved November 20,
2008, iy ¢ Will County Board, the County will provide gptions 0 the public for the
ection, appropriate management, and disposal of Household Hazardous Waste

' when funding is available and in response lo program needs. Furthenmors, pursuant to R
<" the *“Host Agreement and Agreement for Qﬁ;ﬂanaﬁfﬂa\mio ment of the Wi Counc!iy S
an S

Landfill" with Waste Management, Waste agernent wiil pay for twa Househol

o ‘Hazardons Waste Collection events each spring for the life of the Landfill Agreement. -

. Therefore, the County conducts a minimum of two household hazardous waste collection

- events per year and may conduct up to 9ix events per year. ‘

” ' 'BS Technical Solutions LLC. Please see the attached tables for a

.: As part of the bid the County requested additional services such ag the removal of drums
s mnta,inin%‘r@mdennai!y gencrated waste pharmaceuticals, the delivery of paint collection
- supplies, the rermoval of residentially generated paint from County partner sites, and the
- urpnsportation and proper management for those drums, which include recycling, fuel T
blending and/or incineration. The Resource Recovery and Energy Division requested the
- Purchasing Department to issus RFB’s for the purpose of selecting a contractor to
-provide the outlined services once executed. The contract peried for Household

" Wil} Counisy received acceptable bids from EQ-The Environmental Qualig’ Company, .
- Heritage Environmental Services LLC, Tradebe Treatment & Recgclmg , and Veolia *
reakdown of our ‘
. -evaluation and cost comparisois. The contractors that bid were evaluated on Proposal

" Content, Setvice Abilities, Technical Requirements, Availability, Liability Protection,
" Financial Responsibility &Compliancs liistory, Disposal Costs, Mobilization/Dram
- Delivery & Pick up costs/Paint Collection Costs, and References. The bidder with the

" highest evaluation score and the lowest estimated costs was Tradebe Treatment &
o ;Regg«cﬁng LLC. Therefore, after careful review, Resource Recovery & Energy
T Division staif recommends Tradebe Treatment & Recycling LLC to perform

* ‘Household Hazerdous Waste Collection services for Will County for the next

© - contract period.

S 3 gai'zﬁardous Waste Collection and related services will be from May 1, 2013unti) April 30,7 : .
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ATTACHMENT E
DISPOSAL COST SHEET

» The disposal cost sheet must be completed in its entirty. Provide a unit cost for gach waste
strearn and waste management method. a particular drum size and/or cubic yard box
would not be used for a specific waste stream and/or waste management method then stiike
out that box {(~—--}.

> An additional table is provided for Contractor to list and provide a cost for more
environmentally responsible and/or economical waste management methods for specific
waste streams that may be available and are not already listed within Attachment E. The
additional iable is also for waste streams acceptable by the Contractor that are not listed
within Attachment E.

> Any and all exceptions 1o these specifications must be clearly and completely indicated on
this cost sheet.

Gray scaledfshaded boxes are to remain empty.

Waste Stream & ’ Unit Cost
Waste Management Method

..'.-i J

-Fue! Blended '

R s e TR

- Landf‘lied '
—Incmerated

o Recyc}ed
- Landf lled

$237.00
r:i'

5 :!H-ua... <‘;.

Treated $135.00

B Treated“ T ey "$135.00 ' : . $496.00
- Incmera’{ed i No Bid No Bid | No Bid i No Bid

~Fue# Blended $18.00 $45.00 No Bid : $68.00  1872.00 No Bid




L“-»FuéiBle:ndedw

$49.00 $105.00 No Bid | $140.00 [$170.00 $459.0(
-Incinerated NoBid  |NoBid No Bid
-Fuel Blended $49.00 $92.00 No Bid | $125.00 $170.00 No Bid
‘_-incmerated _ 303,40

ncanerated $160.00

$174.00

$310.00

$174.00

$345.00

R BTt

i“'
0500 | 55000 156000845000

Treated

$03.40

$137.90

T sw!

$182.70

Incinerated

Treated

$93.40

No Bid | $137.90

$137.90

$182.70

$182.70

$49.00
Incmerated 7 L $49.00
@}% ig Bighids PentaRe

incmerated

$49.00

No Bid

$137 90_

No Bid | $137.80

$182 7(}

§255.00

$167.50 $495.{)




ATTACHMENT E (Continued)
DISPGSAL COST SHEET

Waste Stream & | Contractor | Minimum | Unit Cost | Unit Cost | Unit Cost (per
Waste Preferred Truck {(30-gallon | (55-galion gallon)
Management Method for Cost drum) drums)
Method Waste
Management
“X!!

-Bulked in Drums X
& Recycled B e
-Bulked in Truck & _.41 (min 2000 gat)
Recycied

-Bulked in Drums
& Burned for Fuels X
or Recycled
-Bulked in Truck &
Burned for Fuels
or Recycled

$40.00 | $45.00




ATTACHMENT E (Continued)

T

A ]
-l.oose packed
& fuel blended

DISPOSAL COST SHEET
Waste Stream | Vendor Unit Cost Unif Cost (20 | Unit Cost (30
& Waste Preferred | (Cubic Yard | cubic yard cublc yard
Management Method Box) roll-off roil-o
Me | (mark *X7) dumpster)’ | dumpster)®

$323.060

$2,980.00 $2,980.00

-l.oose packed
& recycled

$400.00 $3,540.00 $3,540.00

-l.oose packed
Solidified & X
ndfil ‘

P oosé'palc'k'ed
& fue!l blended

$210.00 $2,420.00 $2,420.00

$414.00

$3,540.00

a. I roll-off dumpsters are utilized for loose packed paint the invoice cost for paint disposal
will be pro-rated by percentage of paint in roll-off box. Percentage to be mutually agreed
upon at the end of the event by representatives from Contractor and County.

Waste & Waste Management

Bilbs

4 foot fluo $0.73 :,_.

8 foot fluorescent bulbs $0.73 $049 | o s

U-shaped flucrescent bulbs $0.73 $0.32| NoBid|NoBid [NoBid [NoBid No Bid
Compact fluorescent Bulbs $0.73 $032| NoBid| NoBid |NoBid [NoBid No Bid
HID Bulbs $1.98 $0.83| NoBid| NoBid [NoBid |No Bid No Bid
Halide Bulbs $1.98 $0.83! NoBid| NoBid |NoBid |NoBid No Bid

Waste & Waste Management | Unit Cost (Per Other Unit Cost (Specify):

Method pound)
Lead Acid Batteries $0.34
-Recycled




ATTACHMENT E (Continued)
DISPOSAL COST SHEET

> If more environmentally responsible or economical waste management methods are
available other than those already listed for the waste streams within Attachment E

please include those on this additional table. The additional table is also for waste
strearns acceptable by the Contractor that are not already listed within Attachment E.

Metalic Paint incineration Iy $4.75 WTH




ATTACHMENT E {Continued)

DISPOSAL COST SHEET

Listed below are materials typically considered as ‘unacceptable’ household hazardous
waste within the County’s program. At the County’s discretion and depending on the
Contractors service capabilifies, the County may or may not accept these items at future
events. Please complete the waste streams acceptable by your company’s service, If
unable to accept a waste indicate as “No Bid”. Gray scaled/shaded cells are to remain

blank.
Unit Cost
Per Per l.oose Loose | Loose Other
Wastie Stream & Cylinder/ | Pound packed | packed | packed | (Specify)
Waste Management | canister in30gal |inb5 in cubic | :
Method drum gal yard
drum hox

-Handheid $12.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
~Small $14.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ne Bid
-Medium $30.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

~La rge

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Method

$130.001$175.00

-Small £65.00 NoBid Mo Bid NoBid ___ NoBid No Bid
-Medium 575.00 NoBid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
-Small $25.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
-Medium $35.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Large $35.00 No Bid  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Waste 5~ 15- 20~
Waste Management

w~u§ec.i' & unused
Sharps/needles

$130.00/ $199.00

No Bid |No Bid

3



ATTACHMENT G

MOBILIZATION, DRUM DELIVERY AND PICKUP, AND PAINT COLLEGTION SITE COST

SHEET

For Mobile HHW Collections, Drum/Supplies Delivery and Pickups from County

Warehouse, and Paint Collection Site Cosis

Including all labor, matetial, equif:;r'ne‘h't, forklift rental, portable toilet

rental, cardboard recycling, and transportation necessary to plan, $3,855.00
manage, operate, tear down, and transport off-site a HHW mobiie

collection event based on a participation of 500 vehicles.

Incremental price increase in mobilization costs {o account for an ) $49.00
increase in increments of each 1% of vehicles above 500 vehicles.

Incremental price decrease in mobilization costs to account for a

decrease in increments of each 1% of vehicles below 500 vehicles.® $49.00
Include supply costs only for one (1) new thirty (30)-gallon fiber drum,

one new plastic drum liner, and siorage and fransportation labels for $35.00
one drum.

85-Galion drum overpack cost $120.00

»;g- e
Include ali costs for labor, equipment, and fransportation to conduct a
drop off of empty containers and supplies and/or a pick-up of full
containers of waste at County warehouse located at 806 Nicholson St.,
Joliet, incis 60435, (Do not include supply or waste disposal cosis
here. Supply costs shall be indicated below. Disposal costs from
Attachment E are fo be used for wastes removed from County
Warehouse.)

$465.00

Include supply costs only for ten {10) new thirty (30} -galion fiber
drums, and ten new plastic drum liners, storage labels, and
fransportation labels,

$300.00

Include supply costs only for ten {10) clean, empty five (5) - gallon
plastic buckets/drums with a screw top lid and storage labels and
transporiation labels.

$80.00

] Include ali costs for Iabor equ:pment and transportatlan fo deliver and
unload paint/stain collection supplies at local govwernment site to be
determined within Will County,

$495.00

Include supply costs for a set of paint/stain collection supplies. One set
inciudes a stack of ten wooden palleis, ten new or used cubic yard
boxes, ten new cubic yard box liners, and storage labels.

$590.00

include all costs for labor, equipment, and transportation o unload
paint collection supplies and to load fll cubic yard boxes of paint
andjor stain at a local government site to be detemmined within the
County. (Do not include any transportation of paint/or stain to recycling
or disposal location. Do not include any disposal costs here.)

$125.00

Include all costs fo transport a load of cubic vard boxes full of

1

Attachment G




paint/stain from a local government site to be detemnined within the
County fo a Destination Facility listed by Contractor for this waste
stream in Attachment F (o not include disposal costs here, disposal
costs from Attachment E will be used.).

- Semi/Van-load of latex palnt/stains within cubic yard boxes to

be transporied to Destination Facility listed by Contractor for $450.00
Recycling.

- Box fruck-load of latex paint/stains within cubic yard boxes to
be fransported to Destination Facllity listed by Contractor for $395.00
Recycling.

- SemifVan-oad of latex paint/stains within cubic yard boxes fo
be transported to Destination Facility listed by Contractor for
Solidification & Landfilling. $450.00

- Box truck-oad of latex paint/stains within cubic yard boxes to $395.00
be fransported to Destination Facility listed by Contractor for ’
Solidification & Landflliing.

- Semi/Vanoad of latex paint/stains and oll based paint/stains
within cubic yard boxes to be transported to Destination Facility | $450.00
listed by Confractor.

A— Box truck-load of latex paini/stains and oil based paint/stains
within cubic yard boxes to be transported to Destination Facility | $395.00
listed by Contractor,

include all costs to transport a semifvan load of cubic yard boxes full of }
latex paint only from a local government site to be determined within
the County to the following paint reuse facility: Matthew Ministries
located at 11060 Kenwood Rd, Cincinnati, Ohio, 45242 (Do not inciude
disposal costs here. Any disposal costs will be handled directly
between paint reuse facility and County). Approximate distance/travel
fime: 310 miles/5 hours,

- Per mile cosi $1.80

- Pertrip cost

Notes:

a. Any and all exceptions to these specifications must be cleary and completely indicated on
the bid sheet.
b. Bid in increments of 1% above 500 vehicles. For invoice purposes the following formula
example should be used in the case of an increase in participation above 500 vehicles.
Example: Actual number of vehicles at example event = 560 vehicles
Unit Price designated by CONTRACTOR for increase in vehicles for each
1% above 500= $25

560 vehicles — 500 vehicles = 80 vehicles/ 500 vehicles = .12 x 100 =
12(%) x $25 = $300 increase in mobilization costs.

¢. Bid in increments of 1% below 500 vehicles. For invoice purposes the following formula
example should be used in the case of a decrease in participation below 500 vehicles.
Example: Actual number of vehicles at example event = 457 vehicles
Unit Price designated by CONTRACTOR for decrease in vehicles for each
1% below 500 = $25

500 vehicles — 457 vehicles = 43 vehicles / 500 vehicles = 0.086 x 100 =
8.6(%) x $25 = $215 decrease in mobilization costs.

2 Attachment G



