OFFICE OF WILL COUNTY EXECUTIVE
LAWRENCE M. WALSH

Rita Weiss (815) 740-4605
Purchasing Director Fax (815) 743-4604
rweiss@willcountyillinois.com

BID # 2013-28
SHNH HOUSEKEEPING SUPPLIES BID

ADDENDUM #1
January 9, 2013

We received the following questions regarding this bid:

Question # 1: Dietary and Nursing Supplies and Housekeeping Supplies available on Excel? Please let
me know yes/no - my process co-ordinator would appreciate the Excel - that way she doesn't have to
re-type the bid spec into our systems.

Answer # 1: No, we only issue bids in PDF format.

Question # 2. Regarding the above mentioned bid, Can you please provide me with the current and or
most recent awarded vendor(s) and pricing for the items listed in this bid?

Answer # 2. See the attached bid forms for current pricing and current vendors for the previously
awarded bid 2010-21 Miscellaneous Paper Products. Bid 2013-21 has been spiit into two separate
bids and several items have been removed, modified and/ or added.

Question # 3: Can you supply us with the award pricing and winning vendor from the last bid for the can
iners, items no, 5 through 8 on the current bid, and the date of the last award?

Answer # 3. See Answer #2 above.
Questicn # 4: f there were any price increases, can you also supply us with this information?
Answer #4: See Answer #2 above, prices increases would be notated on bid form,

Question # 5: What was the thickness, case count (liners per case) and case weight (Ibs. per case)
purchased for each size can liner?

Answer #5: Please refer to the specs for the required thickness for all items listed on the bid. The
case count is listed for each vendor on the attached bid forms (see Answer #2 above). We do not
request or frack the weight (ibs. per case) for orders.

Question # 6. Can we cali FedEx at our expense and pick up a sample bag of each can liner currently
being used?

Answer#6: No, the previous bid 2010-21 has expired and we cannot guarantee that the products we
have in our stock match the specs that are included on this bid.

RW/mmf



BID # 2013-28
SHNH HOUSEKEEPING SUPPLIES BID

ADDENDUM #1
January 9, 2013

Question # 7. Based on past ordering history, can you telf us approximately how many cases of each
size can liner are ordered at a time, and about how often are orders placed?

Answer # 7:

5.

CAN LINERS: 40" X 48"
-30 cases per order, 3 orders per month (30 case/mo)

CAN LINERS: 30" X 47"
-10 cases per order, 2 orders per month (20 case/mo)

CAN LINERS: 30" X 37"
- new item, no order history available

CAN LINERS: 24°x33"
-00 cases per order, 3 orders per month (30 case/mo)

CAN LINERS: 40" X 46"
-10 cases per order, 3 orders per month (30 case/mo)

Question # 8. Are the two bids just split up from the original 2013-21 Misc Paper Products with identical

items?

Answer # 8;

Bid 2013-21 has been split into two separate bids and several items have been removed,

modified and/ or added.

Question # 9: Do we need to re-submit samples for these two new bids?

Answer # 9

Yes, if you are planning on bidding on the new bid(s), you must submit samples for

evaluation of your bid(s) will not be considered.

Question # 10 Do we need to re-submit bid bonds for these two new bids?

Answer # 10: Yes, if you are planning on bidding on the new bid(s), you must submit bid bond(s) for
each of the newly released bid(s) or your bid(s} wili not be considered.

RW/mmf



Date Mailed: 10-19-09 COUNTY OF WILL CONTRACT FOR

Due: 10-30-09, 11:00 A.M. PURCHASING DEPARTMENT SHNH #2010-21
Open: 10-30-09, 11:10 A M. 302 N. CHICAGO ST. MISC PAPER PRODUCTS
JOLIET, [L. 60432
The Bidder proposes to provide the
products and/or services in accordance

NAME [//4 ﬂ' { l@/’r; / N C“ with the specifications attached herein.
conract__ MEL  Linpw el ceing 3 (o= ?/ 9 9703
sooress_ UYL W JUtP <4 ,
CITY C g I statelg (ol JLe  prease check one: ~
EMAIL / Minority Vendor yes @
prone_ "SI L Ll KK ¥ eax_ SI2 M2l Y&

THIS IS NOT AN ORDER
Agency Name and SUNNY HILL NURSING HOME OF WILL COUNTY,
Delivery Address: 421 DORIS AVENUE, JOLIET, 1l 60433
For additional
information contact; RITAWEISS, PURCHASING rweiss@willcountyillinois.com

YOU MUST LIiST ON THE LINE BELOW EACH DESCRIPTION YOUR PRODUCT INFORMATION.
I.E. Brand, Part #, Qty per Pkg and Case Count
Quantities are based on last year’s usage and could vary depending on individual resident usage and facility census.
This bid may be awarded in whole or in part, by line item.

(TEM # | DESCRIPTION QTY | UNIT COST | EXTENDED COST
#1 | TOILET PAPER ar0 | 3196 76 4o, 00
Scn TS0 E A 12774
#2 | MULTIFOLD HAND TOWELS oo | 14y G 1940 o
PUTREY # Pup 2 " "
#3 | FACIAL TISSUES Lo 13,38 Fo2- FO
CRerelwepts YCT )2 71
#4 | CAN LINERS 40" X 46" CLEAR g | /643 V3.0 0% 0
ShiEnps # Ci Hpdb foB ’
#5 | CAN LINERS 24” X 24" CLEAR 000 | G4 N7,
Pty Bk deHamauob | . |
#6 | CAN LINERS 30" X 47" CLEAR ;;a/p P /Q,/'z{,, &) 84, 4/@
S HIDEAS tN 327K 1
#7 | CANLINERS 24" X 33REB LAl | oo™ [ o {7 1 2876 - 4P
RETVRLlL W AUIR0Y |
#8 | STYROFOAM DINNER PLATES 9" NANRY 63 49 Lf
DReY  de b Fwe
#9 | STYROFOAM CAKE PLATES 6 I 12D /973 Lo
A A%




ITEM# | DESCRIPTION QTY | UNIT COST | EXTENDED COST
%10 | CUTLERY SETS DISPOSABLE 1o J0.4.3 /0 b 30
L Wk RPS-0boC
#1 | DISPOSABLE FORKS MED WT 20 | bays [§3.50
C Ly J~ 4 BL/000 B ]
#12 | DISPOSABLE SPOONS MED WT 30 645 193.50
Chiw s A BSape0 |
#13 | DISPOSABLE KNIVES MED WT 2.0 L. 47T 12660
Chwtt-  H 8BS Reop0
#14 | DISPOSABLE SPOONS ICE TEA MY .
#18 | CLEAR DRINKWARE FLEXIBLE 9 OZ 70| &/p —
#16 | CLEAR DRINKWARE STRONG 9 OZ 29| BRID —
#17 | DISPOSABLE COFFEE MUGS 80Z NV RIS —
#18 | STYROFOAM CUPS 80Z 121 Jbar 165 2y
W eyp  # ) ECN
#19 | STYROFOAM CUP LIDS 80Z. b | 3o AW -1
N eve  Fwir £el, '
#20 | STYROFOAM CUPS 100Z 260 19,5"? 06 3,40
Wi Lf B Wil iee 0 o
#21 | PAPER CUPS 5 OZ ol Ry o —t
#22 | DISPOSABLE DRINKING STRAWS 20 | 36:320 V24 00
L
#23 | DISPOSABLE BOWLS 5 OZ 15 J077 7¢ Y £
pREY  Hhe CRZ. |
#24 | DISPOSABLE BOWL LIDS Ng B>
#25 | DISPOSABLE BOWLS 8 OZ 151 2996 | 434,38
bpoY hhe §p 72 | |
#26 | DISPOSABLE BOWLS 12 OZ & | 34121 29200
PREY g DL 3




~ ITEM# | DESCRIPTION QTY | UNIT COST | EXTENDED COST
| #27 | DISPOSABLE TRAYS WHITE N RIK e
#28 | DISPOSABLE PAPER BAG #8 b D —
#29 | DISPOSABLE PAPER BAG #4 o BD e
#30 | DISPOSABLE SANDWICH BAG N Bib ——
#31 | DISPOSABLE SILVERWARE BAG Mo RID .
#32 | PLASTIC BAG 18" X 24" CLEAR Vol RiD —
#33 | DISPOSABLE APRONS MED WT 2.0 20Lq 73] 0
Cuk BOVR  CoRPA 2FYL  Im/es ) .
#34 | FOIL ROLL W/CUTTER BOX 18'X1000° | jp YA afe6. 40
#35 | FILM WRAP WICUTTER BOX 18'X1000' | ,, | <, 22| /{3.84
DULABLE AN 02—
#36 | TABLECLOTH ROLL WHITE No-L DD —
#37 | TABLECLOTH ROLL NAVY BLUE VU I RID S
#38 | TABLECLOTH ROLL PLUM 0 iy —
#39 | TABLECLOTH ROLL HUNTER GREEN | ,, ¢ RiD M
#40 | TABLECLOTH ROLL PINE GREEN MO | RID ————
#41 | TABLECLOTH ROLL MERLOT 7o | BID I
#42 | TABLECLOTH ROLL RED WERIE ER—
#43 | TABLECLOTHROLL CARIBBEANBLUE | /¢ | 3D ——




[TEM # | DESCRIPTION STV [ UNIT COST | EXTENDED COST
743 | TABLECLOTH ROLL ENGLISHROSE | 0 | [ /> —
#45 | TABLECLOTH ROLL ORANGE ol BIb E——
746 | TABLECLOTH ROLL YELLOW ~o | BN
#47 | TABLEGLOTH ROLL RED GINGHAM ~U | R —
748 | BEVERAGE NAPKINS HUNTER GREEN | o5 | R I 1N —
#49 | BEVERAGE NAPKINS RED ~NO | RID —
#50 | BEVERAGE NAPKINS NAVY BLUE ~O | BID —
#51 | BEVERAGE NAPKINS VORY NO | RID —

#52 | BEVERAGE NAPKINS CLASSIC WHITE | o | SN E—
753 | BOUFFANT HAIR COVERING WHITE | /9 | 2090 | 209,00

cvabors WLl Peovw/y el

#54 | COFFEE STIRRER 7’ No| BB |
#55 | BUN RACK COVER 52" X 80" ~ O Bin | —
#56 | DINNER NAPKINS NAVY BLUE NTRI e
#57 | DINNER NAPKINS HUNTER GREEN Mo | RIB e
#58 | DINNER NAPKINS MERLOT O RIS ———
#59 | DINNER NAPKINS RED vo | BID P———
#60 | DINNER NAPKINS DELUXE IVORY Vol B/ | ———




ITEM # | DESCRIPTION QTY | UNIT COST | EXTENDED COST
#61 | PLACEMAT GOOD MORNING NYIRAYES
#62 | PLACEMAT TUSCANY wi | Bip e
#63 | PLACEMAT COMBO HAPPY BIRTHDAY | 5 | B & ————
#64 | PLACEMAT COMBO PATRIOTIC vy | B —
#65 | PLACEMAT COMBO VALENTINE ND | RID e
#66 | PLACEMAT COMBO ST. PATRICK'S ~O | R s
#67 | PLACEMAT COMBO PACK EASTER ~No | B)p —
#68 | PLACEMAT COMBO FATHER'S DAY NI i
#69 | PLACEMAT COMBO HALLOWEEN T R D e
#70 | PLACEMAT COMBO THANKSGIVING NO | RN I
#71 | PLACEMAT COMBO NEW YEAR 'N 0 | ) N
#72 | WIPES FOODSERVICE Y, K N .
#73 | TOWELETTE WET NAP NI ——
#74 | CAN LINERS 24" X 33" RED ol BIp —
#75 | BAG POLY, RECLOSEABLE ~ol RN —_—
#76 | MEDICINE GRAD CUP 10Z. 0 [ (D —
#77 | PLACEMAT PAISLEY N 21D —




ITEM# | DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT COST | EXTENDED COST
478 | PLASTIC LID MUG 80Z. 0 B /‘j’) o
#79 | PLASTIC LID BOWL 90Z. NMD 02 D e,

#80 | CAN LINERS 40" X 46" RED M B [D e
#81 | LATEX GLOVES LARGE Nr} é} ]JS R
#82 | LATEX GLOVES MEDIUM Y. & /}3 e E—
TOILET PAPER HOLDERS N D E lqb R
PAPER TOWEL HOLDERS N J} / 0 e
Lead Time AR.O. __/~ .7 Days

Grand Total for year one:

r

s < 319,56

GRAND TOTAL FOR YEAR ONE IN WRITTEN WORDS BELOW:

Optional Year two (2) Percentage Increase

7%

Optional Year three (3) Percentage Increase

VA,

Additional Percentage Discount if awarded in its entirety

signod 5y, Tids omotino  ( mec Liodpeh)

Title:  SALpl MANA LEP.

Approved by:

KAREN SORBERO, SUNNY HILL NURSING HOME OF WILL COUNTY ADMINISTRATOR




Present usage of current product yearly: 25 cases

TOILET PAPER HOLDERS

The toilet paper and paper towel dispensers Sunny Hill is currently using afe as follows:

Toilet Tissue Dispenser, Chrome, Single roll holder, with spindle, recessed, 5-1/2" x 5-
12" x 2"
Model No. 7402BD

Toilet Tissue Dispenser, Chrome, single roll holder, with spindle, attaches to wall
6" x 4-1/2" x 2-3/4", 20 gauge steel,
Model No. SAN R200XC

Toilet Tissue Dispenser, Chrome, double rofl holder, with spindles, attaches to wall,
12-1/2" width x 5-3/4” depth x 8-1/2” height, gray see-through plastic cover
Model No. GPC521-02

PAPER TOWEL HOLDERS

Paper Towel cabinet, holds multi-fold paper towels) True-Fold, metal front, (break
resistant plastic back); lockable, front face lock; 11-5/8" x 5" x 14-1/2", whité finish
Dispenser, wall-mounted.
Model No. SANT19056WH

Date Mailed: 10-18-09 COUNTY OF WILL
CONTRACT FOR
Due: 10-30-09, 11:.00 A.M. PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
SHNH #2010-21
Open: 10-30-09, 11:10 AM. 302 N. CHICAGO ST.
MISC PAPER PRODUCTS
JOLIET, IL. 60432
The
Bidder proposes to provide the
products

andfor services in accordance
NAME  ©&8p 10 T K)egpewdd- TREK with the
specifications attached herein.

CONTACT Gér P KlERrJ &N Tr2/-/ FEIN #
6 Y945 4
ADDRESS 2ASG B¢ et 2.1

oIry 71800 K 4 STATE & zip L0YY¥7  Please




check one:

Al oS K LE@nW Av @ YAreo . C e

ves

Minority Vendor___

PHONE_ &/~ ¢ T1- A2,/ FAX
KT 7~ 29 &F
THIS IS NOT AN ORDER

Agenéy Name and
Delivery Address:

SUNNY HILL NURSING HOME OF WILL COUNTY,
421 DORIS AVENUE, JOLIET, Il. 60433

For additional

information contact:

RITA WEISS, PURCHASING

rwelss@willcountyillingis.com

YOU MUST LIST ON THE LINE BELOW EACH DESCRIPTION YOUR PRODUCT

INFORMATION,

LE. Brand, Part #, Qty per Pkg and Case Count
Quantities are based on last year's usage and could vary depending on individual resident
usage and facility census. This bid may be awarded in whole or in part, by line ifem.

[TEM | DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT | EXTENDED COST
# cosT
#1 | TOILET PAPER oo 2. 9¢ ¥ 2¢0 g
Baf wes7  Flpt o St
#2 | MULTIFOLD HAND TOWELS co | 1506 7 §30 .60
BAY 15T
#3 | FACIAL TISSUES . > ey
SBoard (K 3y
#4 | CAN LINERS 40" X 46" CLEAR - /2 04 | IS 28y
LA L oAl gL SR A Y2y
#5 | CAN LINERS 24" X 24" CLEAR - P 3 o O
Colarwe  {aie  [eoe/e
#6 | CAN LINERS 30" X 47° CLEAR B Jeh o 3 covoc
/& anse /0%
#7 | CANLINERS 24" X 33" RED ) 1010 7494 0
Coc capac bitle foofe
#8 | STYROFOAM DINNER PLATES @




#9 | STYROFOAM CAKE PLATES 6’ W3
710 | CUTLERY SETS DISPOSABLE ey
7
#1 | DISPOSABLE FORKS MED WT Y / A
7
¥12 | DISPOSABLE SPOONS MED WT W] 7
/
#13 | DISPOSABLE KNIVES MED WT Nz
. £
#i4 | DISPOSABLE SPOONS ICE TEA M 13
;
#15 | CLEAR DRINKWARE FLEXIBLE 90Z WK
) e f
£
#16 | CLEAR DRINKWARE STRONG 9 0Z /J// /3
£
#7 | DISFOSABLE COFFEE MUGS 80Z v
7
{
#18 | STYROFOAM CUPS BOZ Nz
#19 | STYROFOAM CUP LIDS BOZ. W]/5
;
#20 | STYROFOAM CUPS 1007 W8
!
[
#21 | PAPER CUPS 5 OZ WA
‘ 7
#22 | DISPOSABLE DRINKING STRAWS W)
77,
Z
#23 | DISPOSABLE BOWLS 5 0Z Wi
/
#24 | DISPOSABLE BOWL LIDS

VIR




#25 | DISPOSABLE BOWLS 8 OZ ) / 4
4
#26 | DISPOSABLE BOWLS 12 0Z ﬂ// 5
{
#27 | DISPOSABLE TRAYS WHITE u /K
£
1
#28 | DISPOSABLE PAPER BAG #8 /y/ g
' 7
} .
#26 | DISPOSABLE PAPER BAG #4 M/ ﬁ'
+ ,,.
/
#30 | DISPOSABLE SANDWICH BAG /,// 5
7
/
#34 | DISPOSABLE SILVERWARE BAG ,/u/ 5
- 7
,
#32 | PLASTIC BAG 18" X 24” CLEAR ﬁ//g
/
/
#33 | DISPOSABLE APRONS MED WT /,// ﬁ
[
4
#34 | FOIL ROLL WICUTTER BOX 18"X1000° ﬂ// yg
T
/
#35 | FILM WRAP W/CUTTER BOX 18"X1000' W / I
[
N
#36 | TABLECLOTH ROLL WHITE /,// /g
’ /
#37 | TABLECLOTH ROLL NAVY BLUE ,a// A
-
#38 | TABLECLOTH ROLL PLUM P / JZ4
P
#39 | TABLECLOTH ROLL HUNTER GREEN /,//g
/
#40 | TABLECLOTH ROLL PINE GREEN /3




#41 | TABLECLOTH ROLL MERLOT M/ s
v
/" o
#42 | TABLECLOTH ROLL RED W/ &
: ; ¥
#43 | TABLECLOTH ROLL CARIBBEAN BLUE f,// ﬁ
7
_/
#44 | TABLECLOTH ROLL ENGLISH ROSE ;u/ﬁ
a
#45 | TABLECLOTH ROLL ORANGE /.) / et
A
#46 | TABLECLOTH ROLL YELLOW /V/f\’f'
. i f’/ -7
#47 | TABLECLOTH ROLL RED GINGHAM v //_/j
o
#48 | BEVERAGE NAPKINS HUNTER GREEN /V / /6
J
/
#49 | BEVERAGE NAPKINS RED N / A
!
]
#50 | BEVERAGE NAPKINS NAVY BLUE /»’/ /(j
[
yy
#51 | BEVERAGE NAPKINS IVORY // D
7
IS
#52 | BEVERAGE NAPKINS CLASSIC WHITE /Z/ / g
/
A
#53 | BOUFFANT HAIR COVERING WHITE /1// /g
#54 | COFFEE STIRRER 7" ﬁ//;f
/
#55 | BUN RACK COVER 52" X 80" ,V/,js
#56 | DINNER NAPKINS NAVY BLUE W3




#57 | DINNER NAPKINS HUNTER GREEN ,y,// ,g
i
#58 | DINNER NAPKINS MERLOT Y / ﬁ
/
1
#59 | DINNER NAPKINS RED M /g
/’/I
#60 | DINNER NAPKINS DELUXE IVORY /’l/ / /6
/
{
#61 | PLACEBIAT GOOD MORNING ) / ,5
/
i
#62 | PLACEMAT TUSCANY /\/ / ﬁ
[
)
#63 | PLACEMAT COMBO HAPPY BIRTHDAY ,u/ ﬁ
/
{
#64 | PLACEMAT COMBO PATRIOTIC V/\/ / (5
/
]
#65 | PLACEMAT COMBO VALENTINE N D
‘ / /
,
#66 | PLACEMAT COMBO ST. PATRICK'S }M// ﬁ
y
#87 | PLACEMAT COMBO PACK EASTER fu/ﬁ
/
. . I
T #68 | PLACEMAT COMBO FATHER'S DAY Iy / (,g
/1
{
#69 | PLACEMAT COMBO HALLOWEEN Y / B
/
#70 | PLACEMAT COMBO THANKSGIVING Iy /,@
il
#71 | PLACEMAT COMBO NEW YEAR /1// A
!
#72 | WIPES FOODSERVICE NS




#73 | TOWELETTE WET NAP NP
¥
#74 | CAN LINERS 24" X 33" RED b0 05 w0
COLCH Ak b o 5T ,
#75 | BAG POLY, RECLOSEABLE ,\)/ A
#76 | MEDICINE GRAD CUP 10Z. J / y
]
LACGE PAISLEY W
#77 | PLACEMAT / /ﬁ
#78 | PLASTIC LID MUG 80OZ. W/ /3
14
8/
#79 | PLASTIC LiD BOWL 90Z. 1/ / A
#80 | CAN LINERS 40" X 46" RED pyy P
COLORE T8 pIIC 1 25,
#81 | LATEX GLOVES LARGE 22.00 FOOD
#82 | LATEX GLOVES/MEDIUM 2, @0 560 %
L olidy, Zepa
TOILET PAPER HOL'DERS 13.00
GPe 52/ 02
PAPER TOWEL HOLDERS 1G 0%
ST [Fes wH
Lead Time A.R.O. S/ Days

Grand Total for year one:

s 4G g ©

GRAND TOTAL FOR YEAR ONE IN WRITTEN WORDS BELOW:

Chizzend thees Justreod o Mﬂw o ES o —

Optmnal ear two (2) Percentage Increase

7%

Optional Year three (3) Percentage Increase




Date Mailed: 10-19-08 COUNTY OF WILL CONTRACT FOR

Due: 10-30-09, 11:00 AM. PURCHASING DEPARTMENT SHNH #2010-21

Open: 10-30-09, 11:10 A.M. 302 N. CHICAGO ST. MiSC PAPER PRODUCTS
JOLIET, IL. 60432

The Bidder proposes to provide the
products and/or services in accordance

NAME GORDON FOOD SERVICE with the specifications attached herein.
CONTACT GAYLAN STIELOWY F.ELN# 38-1240848
ADDRESS 333 SQUTH FIFTIETH STREET
CCITY GRAND RAPIDS STATE M| ZIP49501 Please check one:
EMAIL_GAYLAN.STIELOW@GFS.COM Minority Vendor ves X no
PHONE_1-800-068-4199 FAX
THIS 1S NOT AN ORDER
Agency Name and SUNNY HZLL NURS!NG HOME OF WILL COUNTY,
Delivery Address: RIS A E. JOLIET, 1L 60433
For additional
information contact; RITA WEISS, PURCHASING rweiss@willcountyillinois.com

YOU MUST LIST ON THE LINE BELOW EACH DESCRIPTION YOUR PRODUCT INFORMATION.
L.E. Brand, Part #, Qty per Pkg and Case Count
Quantities are based on last year's usage and could vary dependmg on individual resident usage and facility census.
This bid may be awarded in whole or in part, by line item.

TEW# | DESCRIPTION oTY  [UNIT COST | EXTENDED COST
#1 | TOILET PAPER |

115725 | TISSUE TOILT 96-500 MAINST 250 38.75 968750
% | WULTIFOLD HAND TOWELS

512857 | TOWEL MULTIFOLD NAT 16-250 GFS | 500 1539 5195.00

#3 | FACIAL TISSUES
136170 | TISSUE FACIAL 2PLY 30-100 MAINST 60 17.96 1077.60

#4 | CAN LINERS 40" X 46" CLEAR

524557 | LINER CAN CLR 40-45GAL 1.5MiL 100 1400 19.75 27650.00
GFS
#5 | CAN LINERS 24" X 24" CLEAR
303755 g;\[g?{ CAN CLR 7-10GAL .45MIL 1M 250 19.15 4£937.50

#6 | CAN LINERS 30" X 47" CLEAR

| 438545 | LINER CAN CLR 33GAL 16 MIC 250CT 75 15.25 1143.75
GFS

#7 | CAN LINERS 24" X 33" RED .
535842 | LINER CAN CLR 12-16GAL 8MIC 1M 180 19.96 3592.80




Ra—

ITEM #

DESCRIPTION

QTY

UNIT COST

EXTENDED COST

GFS8

#8

STYROFOAM DINNER PLATES ¢”

275077

PLATE FM 8" UNLAM WHT 4.125 GFS

28

18.76

525.28

#9

STYROFOAM CAKE PLATES 6"

240532

PLATE FM 6" WHT 8-125 GFS

16

18.76

300.16

#10

CUTLERY SETS DISPOSABLE

424366

CUTLERY WRPD KFS NAP S&P MED
250 SOLO

10

39.75

397.50

#11

DISPOSABLE FORKS MED WT

329991

FORK PLAS MED WHT FLX POLY 1M
SOLO

30

7.69

230.70

#12

DISPOSABLE SPOONS MED WT

320983

SPOON PLAS MWT WHT FLX POLY 1M
SOLO

30

7.69

230.70

#13

DISPOSABLE KNIVES MED WT

330019

KNIFE PLAS MED WHT FLX POLY 1M
SOLO

20

7.69

163.80

#14

DISPOSABLE SPOONS ICE TEA

225452

SPOON PLAS SODA LTWT WHT FLX
iM SOLO

21.75

65.25

#15

CLEAR DRINKWARE FLEXIBLE ¢ OZ

256471

CUP PLAS 9Z TRANSL 24-100 GFS

63.95

383.70

#16

CLEAR DRINKWARE STRONG 8 OZ

BTA8T2

CUP PLAS 8Z CLR 8-100 COMT

49.96

299.76

#17

DISPOSABLE COFFEE MUGS 804

422410

MUG PLAS 8Z CLR 24-8 CWARE

t2

58.65

703.80

#18

STYROFOAM CUPS 807

113662

CUP FIM 82 8J8 40-25 DART

12

14.75

177.00

#19

STYROFOANM CUP LIDS 80Z.

1413867

LID VNTD 82 FM WHT GF8JL 10-100
DART

12

8.25

99.00




WEM #

DESCRIPTION

QTyY

UNIT COST .

EXTENDED COST

#20

STYROFOAM CUPS 100Z

270709

CUP FM 10Z 10J10 40-25 DARTY

260

17.95

4667.00

#21

PAPER CUPS 5 OZ

382030

CUP PPR COLD 5Z 30-100 TRMPH

24

88.75

2370.00

#22

DISPOSABLE DRINKING STRAWS

457321

STRAW 7.75” FLEX WHO WRPD 25-
400

20

83.40

1668.00

#23

DISPOSABLE BOWLS 5 OZ

305995

BOWL FM 5Z WHT 5B20 20-50 DART

18

23.10

346.50

#24

DISPOSABLE BOWL LIDS

169331

LID VNTD 8,12,16Z FM 20J1. 10-100
DART

15

13.75

206.25

#25

DISPOSABLE BOWLS 8 OZ

421995

BOWL Fi BZ WHT 8B20 20-50 DART

i5

26.96

404,40

#26

DISPOSABLE BOWLS 12 0Z

1273783

BOWL FM 12Z UNLAM 12B32 20-50
DART

32.95

263.60

#27

DISPOSABLE TRAYS WHITE

285005

TRAY FM 14X18 DBL LAM WHT 100CT
PCTV

76.56

306.24

#28

DISPOSABLE PAPER BAG #8

202575

BAG PPR WHITE 8# 4-500 AJM

81.76

327.04

#29

DISPOSABLE PAPER BAG #4

171956

BAG PPR WHITE 4% 8-500 AJM

107.45

644.70

#30

DISPOSABLE SANDWICH BAG

260266

BAG POLY SAND 7X7" 2M GFS

21.77

130.62

#31

DISPOSABLE SILVERWARE BAG

709433

BAG SADDLE SLVRWARE POLY 2M
ATLNTS

i8

21.11

379.98

#32

PLASTIC BAG 18" X 24" CLEAR




ITEM# | DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT COST | EXTENDED COST
706221 | BAG POLY CLR 2GAL 18X24" 500CT 5 29.44 147.20
TYCO
#33 | DISPOSABLE APRONS MED WT
116467 | APRON POLY EMBOSSED WHT 100CT | 20 16.93 338.60
GFS
#34 | FOIL ROLL W/ICUTTER BOX 18"X1000’
185049 | FOIL CUTTER BX 8TD 18"X10060 1CT 10 17.56 175.60
GFS8
#35 | FILM WRAP W/CUTTER BOX 18"X1600'
115193 | FILM CUTTER BX 18"X2000 1CT GF8 i2 17.85 215.40
#36 | TABLECLOTH ROLL WHITE
525235 | TBLOVR PLAS WHT 40"X100 4 5 37.37 186.85
CONTEM
#37 | TABLECLOTH ROLL NAVY BLUE
529036 | TBLCVR PLAS NAVY 40"X100 4CT 5 37.37 186.85
CONTEM
#38 | TABLECLOTH ROLL PLUM
NO BID NG BID
#39 | TABLECLOTH ROLL HUNTER GREEN
553808 | TBLCVR PLAS HNTR 40"X100 4 5 37.37 186.85
CONTEM
#40 | TABLECLOTH ROLL PINE GREEN
NO BID NO BID
#41 | TABLECLOTH ROLL MERLOT
NO BID NO BID
#42 | TABLECLOTH ROLL RED
520896 | TBLCVR PLAS RED 40"X100 4 CONTEM | 5 37.37 186.85
#43 | TABLECLOTH ROLL CARIBBEAN
BLUE
NO BID NO BID
#44 | TABLECLOTH ROLL ENGLISH ROSE
NO BID NO BID
#45 | TABLECLOTH ROLL ORANGE
NO BID NO BID




ITEM #

DESCRIPTION

QTY

UNIT COST

EXTENDED COST

#46

TABLECLOTH ROLL YELLOW

529095

TBLCVR PLAS YELLOW 40X100 4CT
CONTEM

37.37

186.85

#47

TABLECLOTH ROLL RED GINGHAM

525760

TBLCVR PLAS RED GING 40x100" 1
HOFF

20

12.88

257.60

#48

BEVERAGE NAPKINS HUNTER
GREEN

481033

NAPKIN BEV 2PLY HNTR GRN 12-50
AMERG

20

13.86

277.20

#49

BEVERAGE NAPKINS RED

333408

NAPKIN BEV 2PLY RED 12-50 AMERG

10

13.86

138.60

#50

BEVERAGE NAPKINS NAVY BLUE

353506

NABKIN BEV 2PLY NAVY BLUE 12-50
AMERG

10

13.86

138.60

#51

BEVERAGE NAPKINS IVORY

- [333352

NAPKIN BEV 2PLY10X10 ECRU 12-50
GFs8

10

13.86

138.60

#52

BEVERAGE NAPKINS CLASSIC WHITE

412309

NAPKIN BEV 2PLY CLSC WHT 12-50
AMERG

10

13.86

138.60

#53

BOUFFANT HAIR COVERING WHITE

487244

HAT BOUFFANT WHT 10-100CT GFS

10

50.58

505.50

#54

COFFEE STIRRER 7"

748920

STIRRER 6" UNWRPD RED 10-1000 CT
GFS

10

21.34

213.40

#55

BUN RACK COVER 52" X 80"

465518

COVER BUN PAN RACK 52X80 CLR 50
NPLAS

10

23.60

238.00

#56

DINNER NAPKINS NAVY BLUE

333687

NAPKIN DNNR 2PLY NAVY BLUE 12.50
AMERG

i0

28.08

280.80

#57

DINNER NAPKINS HUNTER GREEN




ITEM # | DESCRIPTION QTyY UNIT COST | EXTENDED COST
481041 | NAPKIN DNNR 2PLY HNTR GRN 12-50 20 28.08 561.6C
AMERG '
#58 | DINNER NAPKINS MERLOT
333654 | NAPKIN DNNR 2PLY BURGND 12-50 28 28.08 702.00
GFS
#59 | DINNER NAPKINS RED
233573 | NAPKIN DNNR 2PLY RED 12.50 AMERG 50 28.08 1404.00
#60 | DINNER NAPKINS DELUXE IVORY
560082 | NAPKIN DNNR 2PLY ECRU 12-50 GFS 50 28.08 1404.00
#61 | PLACEMAT GOOD MORNING
168110 | PLACENMAT GOOD MORNING 1M HOFF 50 26.96 1348.00
#62 | PLACEMAT TUSCANY
167990 | PLACEMAT TUSCANY 1M HOFF 40 32.42 1296.80
#63 | PLACEMAT COMBO HAPPY
BIRTHDAY
1922186 | 2-200 BIRTHDAY COMBO PACK - 5 2819 140.95
856650
#64 | PLACEMAT COMBO PATRIOTIC
912306 | 400-PLACEMAT & NAP PATRIOTIC 3 28.19 84.57
856691
#65 | PLACEMAT COMBO VALENTINE
934500 | 200-COMBO VALENTINE - 856697 1 28.19 28.19
#66 | PLACEMAT COMBO ST. PATRICK'S
926724 | 200-COMBO PACK ST. PATRICKS DA- 1 28.18 28.19
856628
#67 | PLACEMAT COMBO PACK EASTER
932005 | 200-COMBOC PACK EASTER - 856660 1 28.19 28.19
#68 | PLACEMAT COMBO FATHER'S DAY
917817 | 200-COMBO PACK FATHER'S DAY- 1 28.19 28.19
856715
#69 | PLACEMAT COMBO HALLOWEEN
923993 | 200-COMBO PACK HALLOWEEN 1 28.19 28.19




[TEM # | DESCRIPTION QTY  |UNIT COST | EXTENDED COST
PLACE-856699
T#70 | PLACEMAT COMBO THANKSGIVING
726800 | PLACEMAT COMBO PACK THNKS 3 7 26.71 26.71
" 2000T
#71 | PLACEMAT COMBO NEW YEAR
935010 | 200-COMBO HAPPY NEW YEAR - i 78.79 28.19
856669
#72 | WIPES FOODSERVICE
733499 | WET-WIPE PNK STRIPE CHCTWL 200 35 7365 573.75
CHCPE
#73 | TOWELETTE WET NAP
124840 | TOWELETTE WET NAP 10-100CT TRMPH 20 12.97 250.40
#74 | CAN LINERS 24" X 33" RED
733503 | LINER CAN RED 7-10 GAL 1.3 MiL. 500 50 52.78 2639.00
BRYP ‘
#75 | BAG POLY, RECLOSEABLE
466476 | BAG POLY RECLOSEABLE GAL 250CT GFS 10 14.80 148.00
#76 | MEDICINE GRAD CUP 10Z.
518035 | CUP MEDICINE GRADUATED 1Z PLAS 20 33.76 675.20
10-250
#77 | PLACEMAT PAISLEY
559474 25 35.64 841.00
PLACEMAT PAISLEY 1i
¥78 | PLASTIC LID MUG 80Z.
760290 | LID TRNASL 8Z MUG 52 BWL 10- 25 36.56 914.00
150CT
#70 | PLASTIC LID BOWL 90Z.
790300 | LID TRANSL BOWL SHRLNE 9Z 10- 25 36.56 914.00
- 100CT
%80 | CAN LINERS 40° X 46" RED
780014 | LINER CAN RED 40-45GAL 1.0MIL 150 36.17 542550
100BRYP
| #81 | LATEX GLOVES LARGE
397390 | GLOVE VINYL LRG PWDFR 10-100 25 20.98 749.50




ITEM# | DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT COST | EXTENDED COST
#82 | LATEX GLOVES MEDIUM
367381 | GLOVE VINYL MED PWDFR 10-100 25 29.08 749.50
TOILET PAPER HOLDERS
PAPER TOWEL HOLDERS
Lead Time AR.O. Days
Grand Total for year one: $97.609.51

GRAND TOTAL FOR YEAR ONE IN WRITTEN WORDS BELOW:

Nirety-Seven Thousand, Six Hundred, Ninety-nine dollars and fifly one cents.

Optional Year two (2) Percentage Increase

Optional Year three (3) Percentage Increase

Additional Percentage Discount if awarded in its entirety

tgned By éaw/m_.« )‘M@‘/‘—‘

art!e ﬁe’mcnal, /@a&noﬂ 'Deu:ainoeﬂ;

Approved by:

KAREN SORBERO, SUNNY HILL NURSING HOME OF WILL COUNTY ADMINISTRATOR




Date Mailed: 10-19-09 COUNTY OF WiLL CONTRACT FORES.

Due; 10-30-09. 11:00 A.M. PURCHASING DEPARTMENT SHNH #2010-2% "%,

Open: 10-30:09, 11:10 A M. 302 N. CHICAGO ST. MISC PAPER PRODUCTS/Y,
| JOLIET, L. 60432

The Bidder proposes to provide the

! products and/or services in accordan
NAME @Ward bﬁ’)'fl % OOW\P:{VI\/ with tif?e s;}2ci':"s)cat(iaor:sm:;k;tr[acheci‘:)i':'za-g:ir(:f3
CONTACT FEwn % 3U-208- 190y
appress 0500 S Harlem Ave
orry N0 Rveysial arate 1L 2P please eheck one:
EMAIL, bi’,h\’mw\ @ dﬁm Lovvh Minority Vendor, yes X no
pHONE_ 79%- §§3- Q0% eax TOE R3-S0 2 .
Agency Name and
Velivery Address:
For adiﬁonal
information coniact FA WEISS, PUR

YOU BMUST LIST ON THE LINE BELOW EACH DESCRIPTION YOUR PRODUCT INFORMATION,
LE. Brand, Part #, Qty per Pkg and Case Count
Quantities are based on last yeer's usage and could vary depending on individual resident usage and facility census.
This bid may be awarded in whole or in part, by line item.

ITEM # | DESCRIPTION QTY | UNIT COST | EXTENDED COST
#1 | TOILET PAPER 50 | BlBo | 18
DA S T E A |
#2 | MULTIFOLD HAND TOWELS |
DONE"C%P B5q . RAXTE" paddy 560 ,50{% 7(?516952
#3 | FACIAL TISSUES |
DoNE ZPAST B0BOIE I A b0 | 1825 | 10952
#4 | CAN LINERS 40" X 46" CLEAR 0D 1935 | &70 40,60
WSl Jigsd totky 00/ |
#5 | CAN LINERS 24" X 24" CLEAR 350 | 180 | 2950 °2
Woekr J[594-  1000/Cs ' '
# | CANLINERS 30" X 47" CLEAR 2d0. Nik M /4 -
| Wikostor [0D[CS | . L
#7 | CAN LINERS 24" X 33" RED Y {Pr /\) J A I /A’
W Nk T i
#8 | STYROFOAW DINNER PLATES 97 2 o B0 U, 7 %
=1 3 W W
:DL’J?'M 3%‘! ?Pgo \5\{:0 ),Eg\, !
# | STYROFOAM CAKE PLATES ¢’ W 13.50 790,%
BPIL AN '
D%ag o 125 650 /¢ g0

Tl



P

FVEN #

DESCRIPTION

Y

UNIT COST

EXTENDED COST

#10

SUTLERY SETS DISPOSABLE

29.50

3957

Dol ﬁ%}g‘; PACAY # FYAALSSN-NSP

#11

DISPOSABLE FORKS MED WT

v -0

2040

M2260 R3ET5007Z 880
1000 {65

30

#i2

- DISPOSABLE SPOONS MED WT

{p. 80

MZ303 AR TB 002354

B0 |

#13

DISPOSABLE KNIVES MED WT

0

(v 20.

M2Z20{ RO# 7?02‘2—?9"3
‘ oD/

#14

DISPOSABLE SPOONS {CE TEA

N

N

#15

CLEAR DRINKWARE FLEXIBLE ¢ OZ

950

DoNTF TO0AB90 L)amskf‘a# Neqa o
800 Ry a5k

#16

" CLEAR DRINKWARE STRONG 8 OZ

o560

2 YA
DN o e vty

#17

DISPOSABLE COFFEE MUGS 802

N}%

N

T

STYROFOANW CUPS 80Z

12

(450

SO PUTS, JITOIEF eS

#8

STYROFOAM CUP LIDS 80Z.

(2,

%1%

P PrTYT WL UG ALV E
Pon 1000/ CS  [Owta bt 108

#20

- STYROFOAR CUPS 100Z

700 |

[1.50

T e TS

#21

PAPER CUPS 50Z

056

Plel @5 & [G720107
Sv%x%’h'm vPrind _Z2oetg oflop

#22

DISPOSABLE DRINKING STRAWS

%550

o Wre Sthvaw Wi 7

#23

DISPOSABLE BOWLS 5 OZ

2 Vachiv FETW T AR5 f
Pe 3H~w Citeoq/c}:“» 3

2825

SE P PLoR - F0B-
DN E e A FWE-S

#24

- DISPOSABLE BOWL LIDS

L%

6NT ¥ ; VB DLS
G BTG R

#25

DISPOSABLE BOWLS 8 OZ

NG

N iy

#26

DISPOSABLE BOWLS 12 0Z

292%

Do EPln3 PachyH FWAZDON
! 200050

- B 50

AR5



rrém# " DESCRIPTION OTY | UNIT COST | EXTERDED COST
T #27 | DISPOSABLE TRAYS WHITE L,} | Lgu 50 |, %2
' QDaM%D%l"ligqog?\gcéot%MZDbb‘?Z
#28 | DISPOSABLE PAPER BAG #8 SO% 200%
DoN -8 oF VYHZ2000 =
Eﬁm u@ggﬁso%?’ ¥
#59 | DISPOSABLE PAPER BAG #4 P @@q}z 40q%.
Lo RS : 1
7z ?ﬂ‘go’é%bﬁj é%ﬁvﬁf%n AG | |
¢ | DISPOSABLE S ICHB N
| wis )
| M{A
#31 | DISPOSABLE SILVERWARE BAG (€ ZED 530
Dibk 79 Sy prde |
#32 | PLASTIC BAG 18" X 24" CLEAR 2§ 450 U350
= e
DN HE ﬂgﬁoﬁoooﬁhmdi
#3% | DISPOSABLE APRONS MEDWT !\J{ﬁr Uk X / I
N | i
#34 | FOIL ROLL W/CUTTER BOX 18'X1000° | |0 eV B00%
BASZ. Novellis [§T1eDW
#35 | FILM WRAP WICUTTER BOX 18°X1000" || 1250 5622
DINE SO0 Anthor [ o0 LUEZ -
#36 | TABLECLOTH ROLL WHITE N N ; N mn
NIA |
#37 | TABLECLOTH ROLL NAVY BLUE
| N e
| NI |
#38 | TABLECLOTH ROLL PLUM N J }/1( i
N ‘
#39 | TABLECLOTH ROLL HUNTER GREEN N \ . N kp\ Wk
N ! ‘
#40 | TABLECLOTH ROLL PINE GREEN N N JP: N , A
3 § t
NI | :
#41 | TABLECLOTH ROLL MERLOT e N WV , i
' ] {
N A
#49 | TABLECLOTH ROLL RED N N A NIk
Nk |
#43 | TABLECLOTH ROLL CARIBBEANBLUE | nJ Iy f 4 W
N \,A

Up S




ITEM #

DESCRIPTION UNIT COST | EXTENDED COST |
#44 | TABLECLOTH ROLL ENGLISH ROSE Nk e
' i
| N ik
#45 | TABLECLOTH ROLL ORANGE N e A
#56 | mm.ec%ﬁn ROLL YELLOW V4
L YA
#47 mm_w{\c%fi ROLL RED GINGHAM
i s N VP(
#i8 | BEVERAGE NAPKINS HUNTER GREEN 4.0 297 U h
 DOW Ptst% JSO/W&EKV D20%Al -
#49 | BEVERAGE NAPKINS RED 2490 Mg ¢o
DovEPRes | 11O OHL S 020341
#50 | BEVERAGE NAPKINS NAVY BLUE 450 1Jq.90
DVEPE] HeThmaster VLo
#51 | BEVERAGE NAPKINS IVORY LQD AT
1 dSKN :
DR T | |
#52 | BEVERAGE NAPKINS CLASSIC WHITE 2150 | 756D
D)Wﬁ‘?%q TOMSKW 6F0lZ0
#53 | BOUFFANT HA!R COVERING WHITE 42,7150 375%
#54 %ﬁiﬁiﬂ@é&?ﬁm Ll
| MA Mk -
N (A
#55 | BUN RACK COVER 52” X 80"
DoN#5 l’%o% Dﬁ?g”dq“a”ds “TRObFISD 350 13550
#56 | DINNER NAPKINS NAVY BLUE ‘
DDW%%@&%‘%’&OT Uﬁcﬁ—mﬂ&W 6052 5515 230,90
#57 | DINNER NAPKINS HUNTER GREEN
L 5515 | l]-9D
#58 | DINNER NAPKINS MERLOT ' |
BRI 1145 5515 | JALA5
#59 | DINNER NAPKINS RED =S | 05450
V1A HW&%’?OVO *égu LU |
#50 | DINNER NAPKINS DELUXE IVORY .| lpo 4D,
PIBUT * 20513 |
[obo/¢s

LUST U




ITEW # | DESCRIPTION ATY ] UNIT COST | EXTENDED COST
#61 | PLACEMAT GOOD MORNING
. Mo | e AA
#62 | PLACEMAT TUSCANY it |Vl mn
1y
#63 | PLACEMAT COMBO HAPPY BIRTHDAY | i | VR me
Y |
#64 | PLACEMAT COMBO PATRIOTIC | '
| Wl Wik | WK
#65 | PLACEMAT COMBO VALENTINE Yir|
| AL NIE | MiE
#66 PLACEMAT COMBO ST. PATRICKS | Nk vk M=
M i
#67 | PLACENIAT COMBO PACK EASTER | /I | Wik e
4 i
#68 | PLACEWAT COMBO FATHER'S DAY NIk | Mk s
[ 1
#68 | PLACEMAT COMBO HALLOWEEN N A’ A /jr . , /Af
) I
#70 | PLACEMAT COMBO THANKSGIVING Ik IiE =
! 1
#71 | PLACEMAT COMBO NEW YEAR VIE T vk T
I
#73 | WIPES FOODSERVICE Nk | V1A A ﬁ"
| .
#73 TOWELETTE WET NAP §
DOVE Py KT ERPIOND [ 90 | 1250, | ASD:
#74 | CANLINERS 24" X 33 RED VA | VA NS
LGS ‘ ‘
#75 | BAG POLY, RECLOSEABLE o 228D 225%
SONE PUZI, RZ% I520b0ES
#76 | MEDIGINE GRAD CUP 10Z. 20 290 [25%
PGl WINOAE WIC2L 1o
#77 | BLACEMAT PAISLEY ik | WA e
I ! {
N

Jotal 3%




TEN # I BESCRIPTION QTY | UNIT COST | EXTENDED COST |
~ #78 | PLASTIC LID MUG 80Z =y 29,45 (2t -
(Ao HCLSUgBAZ0 1505 - |
#79 | PLASTIC LID BOWL SOZ. 25 | 3715 300255
Cabby0 HCLSAMD |
#80 | CAN LINERS 40" X 46" RED 50 | 19.40 29[0%-
WLosBY I~ | 251(s
#81 | LATEX GLOVES LARGE
J§3 [meo Lg Laky 7 2% | Ho.po (060 %%
#82 | LATEX GLOVES MEDIUM |
JEW [mio (glakey PE 135 | Uboo | (000%
TOILET PAPER HOLDERS
N
PAPER TOWEL HOLDERS
Lead Time A.R.O. ; Days
4
Grand Total for year one: |5, LJg7 () $

| GRAND TOTAL FOR YEAR ONE IN WRITTEN WORDS BELOW:

Seventy Five Thowsand Fouv {yndred Ning <y Two $710/10p —

 Optional Year two (2) Perceniage Increase

 Optional Year three (3) Percentage Increase

| Additional Percentage Discount if awarded in its entirety

Signed By: %% // W

Title:

e

Approved by:

KAREN SORBERD, SUNNY HILL NURSING HOME OF WILL COUNTY ADMINISTRATOR

h{ﬂ\$UU77- 50

25



ITEM # DESCRIPTION GFS MM M MMMW oq | LAPORT Lﬂwwwaﬂwwﬂum mcﬂﬂm”m s \HM- QMMMM EDWARD DON Mwmowhwﬂwa
# TOLIET PAPER 38.75 3176 32.95 31.50 $7.875.00)
¥2 MULTIFOLD HAND TOWELS 16.39 14.98 $7.490.00 15.06 15.95
3 FACIAL TISSUES 17.96 13.38 $802.80 18.88 18.25
4 CAN LINERS 40" X 46" CLEAR - 100C 19.75C 16.43 13180 | $18.284.00 | 19.35C
#5 CAN LINERS 24” X 24" CLEAR - 1000M 19.75 M 5.42 $2,355.00 12.00 M 11.80 M
%6 GAN LINERS 30" X 47” CLEAR - 100C 19.75C $1,443.75)  16.76 14.80C
#7 OAN LINERS 24” X 33" CLEAR -1000M 15.96 M 15.08 52 876,40 | 18.10 D (500}
¥ STYROFOAM DINNER PLATES 8 18.75 12.08 $363.44 16.50
#9 STYROFOAM CAKE PLATES 67 18.75 1210 $193.60 18.50

#10 CUTLERY SETS DISPOSABLE 39.75 10.63 $106.30 39.50

1 DISPOSABLE FORKS MED WT 7.69 5.4 $193.50 5.80

#12 DISPOSABLE SPOONS MED WT 7.65 6.45 $103.50 5.80

#15 DISPOSABLE KNIVES MED WT 7,68 5.45 $129.00 6.80

214 IDISPOSABLE SPOONS ICE TEA .75 $65.25

#15 FLEXIBLE PLASTIC GLASSES 8 OZ 63.95 56.50 $69 50
#16 STRONG PLASTIC GLASSES 9 OZ 49.96 $299.76 76.50

7 DISPOSABLE COFFEE MUGS 807 56.65 $703.80

#18 STYROFOAM GUPS 8 OZ 14.75 16.27 14.50 $174.00
#15 STYROFOAM CUP LIDS 8 OZ. 5.25 $o0.00] 1324 5.75




#20 STYROFOAM CUPS 10 OZ 17.85 19.58 17. 50 $4,550.00
#21 PAPER CUPS 5 OZ 98.75 76.50 $1,836.00
#22 PISPOSABLE DRINKING STRAWS 83.40 36.30 $726.00 85.50

#23 DISPOSABLE BOWLS 5 0Z 23.10 16.97 $254 .55 28.25

#24 DISPOSABLE BOWL LIDS 13.76 $206.25 166.00

#28 DISPOSABLE BOWLS 8 OZ 26.96 $404.40 29.29

#26 DISPOSABLE BOWLS 12 0Z 32.95 $263.60 3412 36.50

#27 DISPOSABLE TRAYS WHITE 78.56 46.50 $186.00
#28 DISPOSABLE PAPER BAG #8 81.76 50.00 $200.00
#29 DISPOSABLE PAPER BAG &.h 107.45 68.00 $408.00
#30 DISPOSABLE SANDWICH BAG 24.97 $130.62

#31 DISPOSABLE SILVERWARE BAG 2111 8.50 $153.00
#32 PLASTIC BAG 187 X 24” CLEAR 20.44 14,50 $43.50
#33 DISPOSABLE APRONS MED WT 16.93 $338.60 36.58

#34 EOIL ROLL W/CUTTER BOX 18”X1000° 17.56 $175.80 28.66 30.00

#35 JFILM WRAP W/CUTTER BOX 187X1000° 17.95 15.32 12.80 $150.00
#36 TABLECLOTH ROLL WHITE 37.37 $186.85

#37 TABLECLOTH ROLL NAVY BLUE 37.73 $186.85

#328 TABLECLOTH ROLL PLUM NO BID

#39 TABLECLOTH ROLL HUNTER GREEN 37.37 $186.85




#40 TABLECLOTH ROLL PINE GREEN NO 81D

#41 TABLECLOTH ROLL MERLOT NO BiD

#42 TABLECLOTH ROLL RED 37.37 $186.85

#43 TABLECLOTH ROLL CARIBBEAN BLUE NO BID

#44 TABLECLOTH ROLL ENGLISH ROSE NO BID

#48 TABLECLOTH ROLL ORANGE NO BID

#46 TABLECLOTH ROLL YELLOW 37.37 $186.85

#47 TABLECLOTH ROLL. RED GINGHANW 12.88 $257.60

#48 BEVERAGE NAPKINS HUNTER GREEN 13.86 §277.20 24.89
#49 BEVERAGE NAPKINS RED 13.8% $138.60 24.80
#50 BEVERAGE NAPKINS NAVY BLUE 13.86 $138.60 24.80
#51 BEVERAGE NAPKINS IVORY 13.86 $138.60 24.80
#52 BEVERAGE NAPKINS CLASSIC WHITE 13.86 37.50 $75.00
#53 BOUFFANT HAIR COVERING WHITE 50.55 20.90 $20%.00 37.50
w54 COFFEE STIRRER 7" 21.34 $213.40

#55 BUN RACK COVER 527 X 808 23.60 13.50 $135.50
#56 DIMNER NAPKINS NAVY BLUE 28.08 $280.80 55.15
#57 DINNER NAPKINS HUNTER GREEN 28.08 $561.60 5515
#58 IDINNER NAPKINS MERLOT 28.08 $702.00 85.15
#59 DINNER NAPKINS RED 28.08 $1,404.00 55.15
#60 DINNER NAPKINS DELUXE IVORY 28.68 $1,404.00 £5.15




#61 DINNER NAPKINS GOOD MORNING 26.86 $1,348.00

#62 DINNER NAPKINS TUSCANY 32.42 $1,296.80

#33 DINNER NAPKINS HAPPY BIRTHDAY COMBO 28,19 $140.98

#64 DINNER NAPKINS PATRIOTIC COMBO 28.19 $84.57

#65 DINNER NAPKINS VALENTINE COMBO 28.19 $28.19

#66 DINNER NAPKINS ST. PATRICK'S COMBO 28.19 $28.19

#67 DINNER NAPKINS EASTER COMBO 28.19 $28.15

#68 DINNER NAPKINS FATHER'S DAY COMBO 28.19 $28.19

#6568 DINNER NAPKINS HALEOWEEN COMBO 28.18 $28.18

#70 DINNER NAPKINS THANKSGIVING COMBO 26.71 $26.71

#71 DINNER NAPKINS NEW YEAR COMBO 28.1% $28.19

#72 DINNER NAPKINS WIPES 22.85 $573.75

#73 TOWELETTE WET NAP 12.97 12.50 £250.00
#14 CAN LINERS 24 X 33 RED - 250/CS 52,78 500 16.10 /500 $805.00

#75 BAG - POLY RECLOSABLE 1 GAL 14.80 $148.00 22.50

#76 MEDICINE GRAD CUP -1 0Z 33.76 31.90 $638.00
#IT PLACEMAT - PAISLEY 33.54 $841.00

#78 CAMBRO MUG LID - SHORELINE 8 OZ 36.56 $914.00 38.45

#79 CAMBRO SOUP BOWL LID - SHORELINE 9 OZ 36.56 32.25 $806.25
#B80 CAN LINERS 40 X 46 RED -125/CS 38.17C 16.60 /125 $2,400.00 19.40 /125




#81 LATEX FOOD HANDLING GLOVES - LARGE, 20.68 $749.50 32.00 40.60

#82 LATEX FOOD HANDLING GLOVES - MEDIUM, 29.88 $748,50 32.00 46.00
#383 TOILET PAPER HOLDER 13.00
#84 PAPER TOWL HOLDER 19.00

s R
2nd yr increse $1.504.23
2nd yr toial $17,005.81 $22,993.23
3rd yr increase $1,190.39 $1.609.52

$18,196.00 $24,602.76

3rd yr total



