OFFICE OF WILL COUNTY EXECUTIVE
LAWRENCE M. WALSH

Rita Weiss {(815) 740-4605
Purchasing Director Fax (815) 740-4604
rweiss@willcountyillinois.com

BID # 2013-29
SHNH DIETARY & NURSING SUPPLIES

ADDENDUM #1
January 9, 2013

We received the following questions regarding this bid:

Question # 1. Dietary and Nursing Supplies and Housekeeping Supplies available on Excel? Please let
me know yes/no - my process co-ordinator would appreciate the Excel - that way she doesn't have to
re-type the bid spec into our systems.

Answer # 1: No, we only issue bids in PDF format.

Question # 2. Regarding the above mentioned bid, Can you please provide me with the current and or
most recent awarded vendor(s) and pricing for the items listed in this bid?

Answer # 2. See the attached bid forms for current pricing and current vendors for the previously
awarded bid 2010-21 Miscellaneous Paper Products. Bid 2013-21 was voided by the Will County
Board and has been split into two separate bids and several items have been removed, modified and/ or
added.

Question # 3; Are the two bids just split up from the original 2013-21 Misc Paper Products with identical
items?

Answer # 3: Bid 2013-21 has been split into two separate bids and several items have been removed,
modified and/ or added.

Question # 4: Do we need to re-submit samples for these two new bids?

Answer # 4: Yes, if you are planning on bidding on the new bid(s), you must submit samples for
evaluation of your bid(s) will not be considered. '

Question #5; Do we need to re-submit bid bonds for these two new bids?

Answer # 5. Yes, if you are planning on bidding on the new bid(s), you must submit bid bond(s) for
each of the newly released bid(s) or your bid(s) will not be considered.

RW/mmf



BID # 2013-28
SHNH HOUSEKEEPING SUPPLIES BID

ADDENDUM #1
January 9, 2013

Question # 7. Based on past ordering history, can you tell us approximately how many cases of each
size can liner are ordered at a time, and about how often are orders placed?

Answer # 7:

5. CAN LINERS: 40" X 46"
-30 cases per order, 3 orders per month (90 case/mo)

6. CAN LINERS: 30" X 47"
-10 cases per order, 2 orders per month (20 case/mo)

7. CAN LINERS: 30" X 37"
- new item, no order history available

8. CAN LINERS: 24"x33"
-00 cases per order, 3 orders per month (30 case/mo)

9. CAN LINERS: 40" X 46"
-10 cases per order, 3 orders per month (30 case/mo)

Question # 8: Are the two bids just split up from the original 2013-21 Misc Paper Products with identical
items?

Answer # 8: Bid 2013-21 has been split into two separate bids and several items have been removed,
modified and/ or added.

Question # 9: Do we need to re-submit samples for these two new bids?

Answer # 9:  Yes, if you are planning on bidding on the new bid(s), you must submit samples for
evaluation of your bid(s) will not be considered.

Question # 10: Do we need {o re-submit bid bonds for these two new bids?

Answer # 10: Yes, if you are planning on bidding on the new bid(s), you must submit bid bond(s) for
each of the newly released bid(s) or your bid(s) will not be considered.

RW/mmf



Date Mailed: 10-19-09 COUNTY OF WILL CONTRACT FOR

Due: 10-30-09, 11:00 AM. PURCHASING DEPARTMENT SHNH #2010-21
Open: 10-30-09, 11:10 AM. 302 N. CHICAGO ST. MISC PAPER PRODUCTS
JOLIET, IL. 60432
_ The Bidder proposes to provide the
" products and/or services in accordance
NAME [/‘4 ﬁ 0 H/T; / N(" with the specifications attached herein.

contact___MEL (QINDNMQ , FELN. # ?Cp- ?/@ 970 3
aooress__LYYY W Ut s+

CITY C i (A ; L. STATEMQ&IP_&_ Please check one: -
EMAIL / Minority Vendor ves @
prone_ &SI - YLl LK &I Fax_ SI2.Y421. ¥¥&]
THIS IS NOT AN ORDER
Agency Name and SUNNY HILL NURSING HOME OF WILL COUNTY,
Delivery Address: 421 DORIS AVENUE, JOLIET, il 60433
For additional
information contact: RITA WEISS, PURCHASING rweiss@willcountyiilinois.com

YOU MUST LIST ON THE LINE BELOW EACH DESCRIPTION YOUR PRODUCT INFORMATION.
|.E. Brand, Part #, Qty per Pkg and Case Count
Quantities are based on last year's usage and could vary depending on individual resident usage and facility census.
This bid may be awarded in whole or in part, by line item.

ITEM # | DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT COST | EXTENDED COST
#1 | TOILET PAPER 250 | 376 76 4, 00
Scn TILCOEE A 1277
#2 | MULTIFOLD HAND TOWELS o0 | 145 ¢ 1450 o
PUTREY #  Pup 2 i '
#3 | FACIAL TISSUES Lo 13,35 Poo-.fO
cReedmepse WET )37
#4 | CAN LINERS 40" X 46" CLEAR Jym | /643 YO0 O
Shyenps H CHHoHs 2R I
#5 | CAN LINERS 24’ X 24" CLEAR 200 | Goys QTP S
RepuBL/e,  dcHauslob | , |
#6 | CAN LINERS 30" X 47" CLEAR 24904 )b 0 a8, Y D
S HITLLL N 3027 R '
#7 | CAN LINERS 24° X 33"-RED LAL/E [ Eo“ 157 f & 2976 L
REFVRLle v audR0lk
#8 | STYROFOAM DINNER PLATES 9 N 3 Y Lf
DREY  De g Pwe |
#9 | STYROFOAM CAKE PLATES 6 16 12. /D [G3 ko
Paey L PwW




ITEM# | DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT COST | EXTENDED COST
#10 | CUTLERY SETS DISPOSABLE X% 10.4.3 /v b 30
L~ & PS-obag
#11 | DISPOSABLE FORKS MED WT 20 e [§3.50
C LN [ + R /08¢ -
#12 | DISPOSABLE SPOONS MED WT 30 (-4 [l 193.50
Chiwlk~  # fpS2000 |
#13 | DISPOSABLE KNIVES MED WT 20 L. 4T 12.6.60
Chwi 4 RS 20p0
#14 | DISPOSABLE SPOONS ICE TEA Y —
#15 | CLEAR DRINKWARE FLEXIBLE 9 0OZ ’O| A1n —_
#16 | CLEAR DRINKWARE STRONG 9 OZ w0 | BID ——
#17 | DISPOSABLE COFFEE MUGS 80Z () @; ’)g —
#18 | STYROFOAM CUPS 80Z 12| /a7 195, 2y
W ey F g ECp
#19 | STYROFOAM CUP LIDS 80Z. B NEEY” 15888
wiNeve  Fwyr £el
#20 | STYROFOAM CUPS 1007 260 19 gtT I q 3,40
w oV A wir e j0
#21 | PAPER CUPS 5 OZ oL B ——1
#22 | DISPOSABLE DRINKING STRAWS 20 30,70 2200
TP e uplb P
#23 | DISPOSABLE BOWLS 5 07 / s /677 ¢ o S [S
DALY Rhe LR 2
#24 | DISPOSABLE BOWL LIDS No B R
#25 | DISPOSABLE BOWLS 8 OZ i 29,96 | 43¢,3 [¢
ARRT he $2 T2
#26 | DISPOSABLE BOWLS 12 0Z [ 34,12~ 292 - ] (P

PREY 4 DL 1B 3




ITEM # DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT COST EXTENDED COST
#27 DISPOSABLE TRAYS WHITE N@ & ”& ' RS-
#28 DISPOSABLE PAPER BAG #8 B G }_:b gy
#29 DISPOSABLE PAPER BAG #4 WU B/‘A e
#30 DISPOSABLE SANDWICH BAG W 0 8/"& N
#31 | DISPOSABLE SILVERWARE BAG ~NO RLD ,

#32 PLASTIC BAG 18" X 24" CLEAR MO E/p ey

#33 | DISPOSABLE APRONS MED WT 20 6.0 73/ F0
Coe DoVR  LorPADEYL  Im/fet | ) -

#34 | FOIL ROLL W/ICUTTER BOX 18°X1000 ,/0 Q J.\ é é a Océ R {p

#35 | FILM WRAP WICUTTER BOX 18X1008°, | 7 | /< 92| /[3 .84

DA BLE AR O ff2—

#36 | TABLECLOTH ROLL WHITE NQ“ /9/'13 w-—/__,-——-w:'-“'

#37 TABLECLOTH ROLL NAVY BLUE N 0 R‘ .D S

#38 TABLECLOTH ROLL PLUM ﬂ/ ‘9 E.ﬂb e

#39 | TABLECLOTH ROLL HUNTER GREEN | . RID S—

#40 | TABLECLOTH ROLL PINE GREEN 0| RIS —

#41 TABLECLOTH ROLL MERLOT W’U ' E /D e

#42 | TABLECLOTH ROLL RED O F,D ey

#43 | TABLECLOTH ROLL CARIBBEAN BLUE i‘/ v B /D T———




ITEM # | DESCRIPTION QATY UNIT COST | EXTENDED COST
#44 | TABLECLOTH ROLL ENGLISH ROSE NG 0} = S
#45 | TABLECLOTH ROLL ORANGE N /}. ):B S
#46 | TABLECLOTH ROL‘L YELLOW AN ﬁ} D
#47 | TABLECLOTH ROCLL RED GINGHAM N & l?hn i
#48 | BEVERAGE NAPKINS HUNTER GREEN N Y, )f} }-D e
#49 | BEVERAGE NAPKINS RED ~N O E/:D
#50 | BEVERAGE NAPKINS NAVY BLUE N Q E”) S
#51 | BEVERAGE NAPKINS IVORY N O /3/»15 e
#52 | BEVERAGE NAPKINS CLASSIC WHITE N B LD e
#53 | BOUFFANT HAIR COVERING WHITE /a 9\@ 90 20 q ﬁa

' I
cRpore W Lol Feobuy mfes

#54 | COFFEE STIRRER 7" Nt) B}’P s
#5565 | BUN RACK CCVER 52" X 80" N O E/_?l e
#56 | DINNER NAPKINS NAVY BLUE N E /,,Zl _—
#57 | DINNER NAPKINS HUNTER GREEN /\/0 Ej,b I
#58 | DINNER NAPKINS MERLOT W@ 13@5 e
#59 | DINNER NAPKINS RED N @/‘D e
#60 | DINNER NAPKINS DELUXE IVORY {\/ O B LB —




ITEM# | DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT COST | EXTENDED COST
#81 | PLACEMAT GOOD MORNING ) @ /}5
#62 | PLACEMAT TUSCANY U é} /,'b S,
#63 | PLACEMAT COMBO HAPPY BIRTHDAY N /P )—15 N —
#64 | PLACEMAT COMBO PATRIOTIC N .@/—b —
#65 | PLACEMAT COMBO VALENTINE ND I} 1D ——e
#66 | PLACEMAT COMBO ST. PATRICK'S N @/:,D ey
#67 | PLACEMAT COMBO PACK EASTER Y, @) b ———
#68 | PLACEMAT COMBO FATHER'S DAY N, JP /‘A I
#69 | PLACEMAT COMBO HALLOWEEN ~N D E /,)D S
#70 | PLACEMAT COMBO THANKSGIVING N E /da N
#71 | PLACEMAT COMBO NEW YEAR tf\/ 7 @ /,b 7
#72 | WIPES FOODSERVICE N @//P —
#73 | TOWELETTE WET NAP YV @ P ——
#74 | CAN LINERS 24" X 33" RED 2y, é}/ b R
#75 | BAG POLY, RECLOSEABLE o @ / f—\— —
#76 | MEDICINE GRAD CUP 10Z. ' G/b .
#77 | PLACEMAT PAISLEY N b} I D ———




ITEM# | DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT COST | EXTENDED COST
-#78 | PLASTIC LID MUG 80Z. B —
no | BID
#79 | PLASTIC LID BOWL 90Z. N 0 Ug /—]> e,
#80 | CAN LINERS 40" X 468" RED Mt B ”3 N
#81 | LATEX GLOVES LARGE Na R ],h T
#82 | LATEX GLOVES MEDIUM e
Ny | BID
TOILET PAPER HOLDERS D 53 /-;D S
PAPER TOWEL HOLDERS NO B / Q e
Lead Time ARO. _/~.7 Days

Grand Total for year one:

"

s of, 34,50

GRAND TOTAL FOR YEAR ONE IN WRITTEN WORDS BELOW:

Optional Year two (2) Percentage increase

7%

Optional Year three (3) Percentage Increase

PV,

Additional Percentage Discount if awarded in its entirety

Signed By: W: W/‘J

Title:_ SALeS MANA LEE

Approved by:

( mee A//VA/V&@

KAREN SORBERO, SUNNY HILL NURSING HOME OF WILL COUNTY ADMINISTRATOR




Present usage of current product yearly: 25 cases

TOILET PAPER HOLDERS

The toilet paper and paper towel dispensers Sunny Hill is currently using are as follows:

Toilet Tissue Dispenser, Chrome, Single roll holder, with spindle, recessed, 5-1/2" x 5~
12" x 27
Model No. 7402BD

Toilet Tissue Dispenser, Chrome, single roll holder, with spindle, attaches to wall
6" x 4-1/2" x 2-3/4", 20 gauge steel,
Model No. SAN R200XC

Toilet Tissue Dispenser, Chrome, double roll holder, with spindies, attaches to wall,
12-1/2" width x 5-3/4” depth x 8-1/2" height, gray see-through plastic cover
Model No. GPCSZH)_%

PAPER TOWEL HOLDERS

Paper Towel cabinet, holds multi-fold paper towels) True-Fold, metal front, (break
resistant plastic back); lockable, front face lock; 11-5/8" x 5" x 14-1/2", white finish
Dispenser, wall-mounted.
Model No. SANT1905WH

Date Mailed: 10-19-09 COUNTY OF WILL
CONTRACT FOR
Due; 10-30-09, 11:.00 AM. PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
SHNH #2010-21
Open: 10-30-08, 11:10 AM. 302 N. CHICAGO ST.
MISC PAPER PRODUCTS
JOLIET, L. 60432
The
Bidder proposes to provide the
products

and/or setvices in accordance ‘
NAME €812 00 T K)sepndi- TREK with the
specifications attached herein.

CONTACT G érp-P WKi€ha A Tr2/-K FEIN. #
36- 4289454 T
ADDRESS 2259  Kg e pEap,

CITY »7inl 00k 4 STATE < zIp Lo{¥7  Please




check one:

EMAIL__ & O K léﬁ?d ﬂn) e Y«M I”{‘C‘d L Minority Vendor___

< yes ) no
PHONE__ &7/~ G 7- R4/ FAX

T~ Je7-29 §F

THIS IS NOT AN ORDEE:
Agenéy Name and SUNNY HILL NURSING HOME OF WILL COUNTY,
Delivery Address: 421 DORIS AVENUE, JOLIET, IL 60433

For additional
information contact: RITA WEISS, PURCHASING

rweiss@willcountyillinois.com

YOU MUST LIST ON THE LINE BELOW EACH DESCRIPTION YOUR PRODUCT
INFORMATION.
L.E. Brand, Part #, Qty per Pkg and Case Count
Quantities are based on last year’s usage and could vary depending on individual resident
usage and facility census. This bid may be awarded in whole or in part, by line item.

ITEM | DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT | EXTENDED COST
# COST

#1 | TOILET PAPER es | 3a. 9¢ & 246 go

BoY wes7  ps a0 st

#2 | MULTIFOLD HAND TOWELS co 16~ 06 7 530 .00

BARY 15T

Boged (oplK 3/

#4 | CAN LINERS 40" X 46" CLEAR & Ty /S 28

SOLan i B J 2 gl [0 /4

#5 | CAN LINERS 24" X 24" CLEAR o f2ae 3 g

Colon?atc {a/c [ ove/e,

#6 | CANLINERS 30° X 47" CLEAR B et Co 3 o

/.l e /09/6

#7 | CAN LINERS 24" X 33" RED 7610 2 gy

2
Col pappnc /e ﬁ’z@/@

#8 | STYROFOAM DINNER PLATES ¢°




#9 | STYROFOAM CAKE PLATES 6’ 3
#10 | CUTLERY SETS DISPOSABLE B
/
#11 | DISPOSABLE FORKS MED WT Ny / A
{
#12 | DISPOSABLE SPOONS MED WT WG
/
#13 | DISPOSABLE KNIVES MED WT W / %
#14 | DISPOSABLE SPOONS ICE TEA Iy / 73
/
#15 | CLEAR DRINKWARE FLEXIBLE 0 OZ
_ VB
f
#16 | CLEAR DRINKWARE STRONG 9 OZ fl// 73
d
#17 | DISPOSABLE COFFEE MUGS 807 VI3
/
#18 | STYROFOAM CUPS 80Z Py /7
#19 | STYROFOAM CUP LIDS 80Z. W //g,
)
#20 | STYROFOAM GUPS 1007 ), / 7
7
/
#21 | PAPER GUPS 5 OZ
. /i3
#22 | DISPOSABLE DRINKING STRAWS %
77
£
#23 | DISPOSABLE BOWLS 5 OZ .z
7
#74 | DISPOSABLE BOWL LiDS ]\////{




#25 | DISPOSABLE BOWLS 8 OZ Y, / 'z
/1
#26 | DISPOSABLE BOWLS 12 OZ /M/ 5
i
#27 | DISPOSABLE TRAYS WHITE /f//ﬁ
/
g
#28 | DISPOSABLE PAPER BAG #8 2 / 4
‘ 7
#29 | DISPOSABLE PAPER BAG #4
i/
/
#30 | DISPOSABLE SANDWICH BAG /q// &
/
/
#31 | DISPOSABLE SILVERWARE BAG ,/u/ A
i
/
#32 | PLASTIC BAG 18" X 24" CLEAR ,«/g
!
/
#33 | DISPOSABLE APRONS MED WT /,// 4
7
1
#34 | FOIL ROLL W/ICUTTER BOX 18"X1000 ﬁ// 72
T
|
#35 | FILM WRAP WICUTTER BOX 18°X1000° % / IZ4
'
#36 | TABLECLOTH ROLL WHITE f.// J4
' 7
/
#37 | TABLECLOTH ROLL NAVY BLUE /x// Z
| .
#38 | TABLECLOTH ROLL PLUM ;u/ i
/
#39 | TABLECLOTH ROLL HUNTER GREEN ﬁ//g
/
#40 | TABLECLOTH ROLL PINE GREEN ,4// /jﬂ




#41 | TABLECLOTH ROLL MERLOT A)/K
7
4
#42 | TABLECLOTH ROLL RED B
[4
#43 | TABLECLOTH ROLL CARIBBEAN BLUE M 7
7
Y,
#44 | TABLECLOTH ROLL ENGLISH ROSE W17
/ .
#45 | TABLECLOTH ROLL ORANGE R
7
i
#46 | TABLECLOTH ROLL YELLOW MR
1 ,( / 7
#47 | TABLECLOTH ROLL RED GINGHAM Wi
i
#48 | BEVERAGE NAPKINS HUNTER GREEN /e
7
/
#49 | BEVERAGE NAPKINS RED W]B
f
/
#50 | BEVERAGE NAPKINS NAVY BLUE 173
f
- .
#51 | BEVERAGE NAPKINS IVORY 775
7
£
#52 | BEVERAGE NAPKINS GLASSIC WHITE A
"
#53 | BOUFFANT HAIR COVERING WHITE /u/g
'
#54 | COEFEE STIRRER 7 w75
Vi
#55 | BUN RACK COVER 52" X 80° WYL,
#56 | DINNER NAPKINS NAVY BLUE

P13




#57 | DINNER NAPKINS HUNTER GREEN /1// ,g
i
#58 | DINNER NAPKINS MERLOT Y. / @
f
¥
#59 | DINNER NAPKINS RED M fg
/
A
#60 | DINNER NAPKINS DELUXE IVORY //L/ / ﬁ
f
/
#61 | PLACEMAT GOOD MORNING /a/ / g
/
/
#62 | PLACEMAT TUSCANY /,./ / ﬁ
T
H
#63 | PLACEMAT COMBO HAPPY BIRTHDAY Y / ﬂ
/
£
#64 | PLACEMAT COMBO PATRIOTIC f\/ / g
14
]
#65 | PLACEMAT COMBO VALENTINE N / ﬁ
'/
i
#66 | PLACEMAT COMBO ST. PATRICK'S /z)/ ﬁ'
i
' /
#67 | PLACEMAT COMBO PACK EASTER f"’//f))
/
‘ ‘ i
#68 | PLACEMAT COMBO FATHER'S DAY A)/ o'%
/4
i
#69 | PLACEMAT COMBO HALLOWEEN Y, / B
/
#70 | PLACEMAT COMBO THANKSGIVING /U/ﬁ
[
17
#71 | PLACEMAT COMBO NEW YEAR M A
f
#72 | WIPES FOODSERVICE




#73 | TOWELETTE WET NAP /
M8
#74 | CAN LINERS 24" X 33° RED b0 @ OF 00
OO R b e 5T ‘
#75 | BAG POLY, RECLOSEABLE ,\// £
#76 | MEDICINE GRAD CUP 10Z. W / £
}
#77 | PLACEMAT PAISLEY ,,J/ /3
#78 | PLASTIC LID MUG 80Z. W//j’
/£
8 f
#79 | PLASTIC LID BOWL 907. 1/ / 6
14
#380 | CAN LINERS 40" X 46" RED J 60 2Y00 o
COLOMRE - To PIC ()T,
#81 | LATEX GLOVES LARGE 22.00 000
#82 | LATEX GLOVESMEDIUM =, a° 500 g
2 o, Zep

TOILET PAPER HOLDERS [3.00

GPc 54/ 02

PAPER TOWEL HOLDERS 15 6%

S 7 Jgas” wH

Lead Time A.R.O. /[ Days

Grand Total for year one:

$ 49 34 €

GRAND TOTAL FOR YEAR ONE IN WRITTEN WORDS BELOW:

Fasichs puzs (hisord  thoes itk

Optional Year two (2) Percentage Increase

WMM o o —

Optional Year three (3) Percentage Increase

7%
7%




Date Mailed: 10-19-09 COUNTY OF WILL CONTRACT FOR

Due: 10-30-09, 11:00 A.M. PURCHASING DEPARTMENT SHNH #2010-21

Open: 10-30-09, 11:10 A.M. 302 N. CHICAGO ST, MISC PAPER PRODUCTS
JOLIET, IL.. 60432

The Bidder proposes to provide the
products and/or services in accordance

NAME GORDON FOOD SERVICE with the specifications attached herein.
CONTACT CAYLAN STIELOW F.E.LN# 38-1249848
ADDRESS_333 SOUTH FIFTIETH STREET
. CITY GRAND RAPIDS STATE Mi Z1P48501 Please check one:
EMAIL_GAYLAN.STIELOW@GFS.COM Minority Vendor yes X _no
PHONE_1-8060-868-4189 FAX
THIS IS NOT AN ORDER
Agency Name and SUNNY HILL NURSING HOME OF WILL COUNTY,
Delivery Address: 421 DORIS AVENUE, JOLIET, [l 60433
For additional
information contact: RITAWEISS, PURCHASING rweiss@willcountyillinois.com

YOU MUST LIST ON THE LINE BELOW EACH DESCRIPTION YOUR PRODUCT INFORMATION.
L.LE. Brand, Part #, Qty per Pkg and Case Count
Quantities are based on last year's usage and could vary depending on individual resident usage and facility census.
This bid may be awarded in whole or in part, by line item.

ITEM# | DESCRIPTION QATY UNIT COST | EXTENDED COST
#1 | TOILET PAPER

115122 | TISSUE TOILT 96-500 MAINST 250 38,75 9687.50
#2 | MULTIFOLD HAND TOWELS

212857 | TOWEL MULTIFOLD NAT 16-250 GFS 500 18.39 9195.00

#3 | FACIAL TISSUES
136170 | TISSUE FACIAL 2PLY 30-100 MAINST 69 17.96 1077.60

#4 | CAN LINERS 40" X 46" CLEAR

524557 | LINER CAN CLR 40-45GAL 1.5MIL 100 14060 19.75 27650.00
GFS
#5 | CAN LINERS 24" X 24" CLEAR
303755 FélggR CAN CLR 7-10GAL 45MiL 1M 250 19.75 4937.50

#6 | CAMLINERS 30" X 47" CLEAR

438545 | LINER CAN CLR 33GAL 16 MIC 250CT 75 15.25 1143.75
| GFS

#7 | CAN LINERS 24" X 33" RED
535842 | LINER CAN CLR 12-16GAL 8MIC 1M 180 15.96 3592.80




ITEM #

DESCRIPTION

QTY

UNIT COST

EXTENDED COST

GFS

#8

STYROFOAM DINNER PLATES 9”

[ 275077

PLATE FM 9" UNLAM WHT 4-125 GFS

28

18.76

525.28

#9

STYROFOAM CAKE PLATES 6"

240532

PLATE FM 6" WHT 8-125 GFS

16

18.76

300.16

#10

CUTLERY SETS DISPOSABLE

424366

CUTLERY WRPD KFS NAP S&P MED
250 SOLO

10

39.75

397.50

#11

DISPOSABLE FORKS MED WT

329991

FORK PLAS MED WHT FLX POLY 1M
SOLO

30

7.69

230.70

#12

DISPOSABLE SPOONS MED WT

320083

SPOON PLAS MWT WHT FLX POLY 1M
SOLO

30

7.69

230.70

#13

DISPOSABLE KNIVES MED WT

[330019

KNIFE PLAS MED WHT FLX POLY 1M
SOLO

20

7.69

153.80

#14

DISPOSABLE SPOONS ICE TEA

225452

SPOON PLAS SODA LTWT WHT FLX
M SOLO

21,75

65.25

#15

CLEAR DRINKWARE FLEXIBLE 90Z

256471

CUP PLAS 9Z TRANSL 24-100 GFS

63.95

383.70

#16

CLEAR DRINKWARE STRONG 9 OZ

574872

CUP PLAS 8Z CLR 6-100 COMT

49.96

299.76

#17

DISPOSABLE COFFEE MUGS 80Z

422410

MUG PLAS 8Z CLR 24-8 CWARE

12

58.65

703.80

#18

STYROFOAM CUPS 802

113662

CUP FM 8Z 8.8 40-25 DART

12

14.75

177.00

#19

STYROFOAM CUP LIDS 80Z.

1113867

LID VNTD 8Z FM WHT GF8JL 10-100
DART

12

8.25

99.00




ATLNTS

ITEM# | DESCRIPTION Qry UNIT COST ;| EXTENDED COST
#20 | STYROFOAM CUPS 1002
1270709 | CUP FM 10Z 10J10 40-25 DART 260 17.95 4667.90
#21 | PAPER CUPS 5 OZ
382030 | CUP PPR COLD 5£ 30-100 TRMPH 24 98.75 2370.00
#22 | DISPOSABLE DRINKING STRAWS
457321 | STRAW 7.75” FLEX WHO WRPD 25- 20 83.40 1668.00
400
#23 | DISPOSABLE BOWLS 5 0Z
305095 | BOWL FM 5Z WHT 5B20 20-50 DART 15 23.10 346.50
#24 | DISPOSABLE BOWL LIDS
169331 | LID VNTD 8,12,16Z FM 20JL 10-100 15 13.75 206.25
DART
#25 | DISPOSABLE BOWLS 8 OZ
421995 | BOWL FM 8Z WHT 8B20 20-50 DART i5 26.96 404.40
F‘ #26 | DISPOSABLE BOWLS 12 0Z
273783 | BOWL FM 122 UNLAM 12B32 20-50 8 32.95 263.60
DART
#27 | DISPOSABLE TRAYS WHITE
285005 | TRAY FM 14X18 DBL LAM WHT 100CT | 4 76.56 306.24
PCTV
#28 | DISPOSABLE PAPER BAG #8
292575 | BAG PPR WHITE 8# 4-500 AJM 4 81.76 327.04
#29 | DISPOSABLE PAPER BAG #4
171956 | BAG PPR WHITE 4# 8-500 AJM 6 1G7.45 644.79
#30 | DISPOSABLE SANDWICH BAG
260266 | BAG POLY SAND 7X7" 2M GFS 6 21.77 130.62
#31 | DISPOSABLE SILVERWARE BAG
709433 | BAG SADDLE SLVRWARE POLY 2M 18 21.11 379.98

#32

PLASTIC BAG 18" X 24" CLEAR




ITEM# | DESCRIPTION QTY | UNIT COST | EXTENDED COST
706221 | BAG POLY CLR 2GAL 18X24" 500CT | 5 29.44 147.20
TYCO
#33 | DISPOSABLE APRONS MED WT
116467 | APRON POLY EMBOSSED WHT 100CT | 20 16.93 338.60
GFS
#34 | FOIL ROLL WICUTTER BOX 18"X1000°
185949 | FOIL CUTTER BX STD 18"X1000 1CT | 10 17.56 175.60
GFS
#35 | FILM WRAP W/CUTTER BOX 18"X1000
115193 | FILM CUTTER BX 18"X2000 1CT GFS | 12 17.95 215.40
#36 | TABLECLOTH ROLL WHITE
525235 | TBLCVR PLAS WHT 40°X100 4 5 37.37 186.85
CONTEM
#37 | TABLECLOTH ROLL NAVY BLUE
520036 | TBLCVR PLAS NAVY 40"X100 4CT 5 37.37 186.85
CONTEM
#38 | TABLECLOTH ROLL PLUM
NO BID NO BID
#39 | TABLECLOTH ROLL HUNTER GREEN
553808 | TBLCVR PLAS HNTR 40"X100 4 5 37.37 186.85
CONTEM
#40 | TABLECLOTH ROLL PINE GREEN
NO BID NO BID
#41 | TABLECLOTH ROLL MERLOT
NO BID NO BID
#42 | TABLECLOTH ROLL RED
520896 | TBLCVR PLAS RED 40"X100 4 CONTEM | 5 37.37 186.85
#43 | TABLECLOTH ROLL CARIBBEAN
BLUE
NO BID NO BID
#44 | TABLECLOTH ROLL ENGLISH ROSE
[NOBID NO BID
1 #45 | TABLECLOTH ROLL ORANGE
NO BID NO BID




ITEM #

DESCRIPTION

QTY

UNIT COST

EXTENDED COST

#46

TABLECLOTH ROLL YELLOW

529095

TBLCVR PLAS YELLOW 40X100 4CT
CONTEM

37.37

186.85

#47

TABLECLOTH ROLL RED GINGHAM

525760

TBLCVR PLAS RED GING 40x100" 1
HOFF

20

12.88

257.60

#48

BEVERAGE NAPKINS HUNTER
GREEN

481033

NAPKIN BEV ZPLY HNTR GRN 12-50
AMERG

20

13.86

277.20

#49

BEVERAGE NAPKINS RED

333409

NAPKIN BEV 2PLY RED 12-50 AMERG

10

13.86

138.60

#50

BEVERAGE NAPKINS NAVY BLUE

333506

NAPKIN BEV 2PLY NAVY BLUE 12-50
AMERG

10

13.86

138.60

#51

BEVERAGE NAPKINS IVORY

- | 333352

NAPKIN BEV 2PLY10X10 ECRU 12-50
GFS

10

13,86

138.60

#52

BEVERAGE NAPKINS CLASSIC WHITE

412309

NAPKIN BEV 2PLY CLSC WHT 12-50
AMERG

10

13.86

138.60

#53

BOUFFANT HAIR COVERING WHITE

487244

HAT BOUFFANT WHT 10-100CT GFS

10

50.55

505.50

#54

COFFEE STIRRER 7"

748920

STIRRER 6” UNWRPD RED 10-1000 CT
GFS

10

21.34

213.40

#55

BUN RACK COVER 52" X 80"

465518

COVER BUN PAN RACK 52X80 CLR 50
NPLAS

10

23.60

236.00

#56

DINNER NAPKINS NAVY BLUE

333697

NAPKIN DNNR 2PLY NAV BLUE 12-50
AMERG

10

28.08

280.80

#57

DINNER NAPKINS HUNTER GREEN




ITEM# | DESCRIPTION QTY | UNIT COST | EXTENDED COST
481041 | NAPKIN DNNR 2PLY HNTR GRN 12-50 20 28.08 561.60
AMERG :
#58 | DINNER NAPKINS MERLOT
333654 | NAPKIN DNNR 2PLY BURGND 12-50 25 28.08 702.00
GFS
#59 | DINNER NAPKINS RED
333573 | NAPKIN DNNR 2PLY RED 12-50 AMERG | 50 28.08 1404.00
#60 | DINNER NAPKINS DELUXE VORY
560082 | NAPKIN DNNR 2PLY ECRU 12-50 GFS 50 28.08 1404.00
#61 | PLACEMAT GOOD MORNING
168110 | PLACEMAT GOOD MORNING 1M HOFF | 50 26.96 1348.00
#62 | PLACEMAT TUSCANY
167990 | PLACEMAT TUSCANY 1M HOFF 40 32.42 1296.80
#63 | PLACEMAT COMBO HAPPY
BIRTHDAY
[922786 | 2-200 BIRTHDAY COMBO PACK - 5 28.19 140.95
856650
#64 | PLACEMAT COMBO PATRIOTIC
912806 | 400-PLACEMAT & NAP PATRIOTIC 3 28.19 84.57
856691
#65 | PLACEMAT COMBO VALENTINE
934509 | 200-COMBO VALENTINE - 856697 1 28.19 28.19
#66 | PLACEMAT COMBO ST. PATRICK'S
926721 | 200-COMBO PACK ST. PATRICKS DA- 1 28.19 28.19
856698
#67 | PLACEMAT COMBO PACK EASTER
932005 | 200-COMBO PACK EASTER - 856660 1 28.19 28.19
#68 | PLACEMAT COMBO FATHER'S DAY
917817 | 200-CONMBO PACK FATHER'S DAY- 1 28.19 28.19
856715
#69 | PLACEMAT COMBO HALLOWEEN
923993 | 200-COMBO PACK HALLOWEEN 1 28.19 28.19




ITEM # | DESCRIPTION GTY ~TUNIT COST | EXTENDED COST
PLACE-856609
#70 | PLACEMAT COMBO THANKSGIVING
[726800 | PLACEMAT COMBO PACK THNKS 3- 7 26.71 3671
| 200CT
¥71 | PLACEMAT COMBO NEW YEAR
935019 | 200-COMBO HAPPY NEW YEAR - 1 78.19 38.19
856669
#72 | WIPES FOODSERVICE
722499 | WET-WIPE PNK STRIPE CHIXTWL 200 25 22.95 573.75
CHCPE
#73 | TOWELETTE WET NAP
124840 | TOWELETTE WET NAP 10-100CT TRMPH 20 12.867 259.40
#74 | CAN LINERS 24" X 33" RED
733503 | LINER CAN BED 7-10 GAL 1.3 ML 500 50 52.78 2639.00
BRYP
#75 | BAG POLY, RECLOSEABLE
AG6476 | BAG POLY RECLOSEABLE GAL 250CT GFS 10 14.80 148.00
#76 | MEDICINE GRAD CUP 10Z.
518035 | CUP MEDICINE GRADUATED 12 PLAS 20 33.76 5675.20
10-250
#77 | PLACEMAT PAISLEY
559474 75 33.64 841.00
PLACEMAT PAISLEY 1M
#78 | PLASTIC LID MUG 807,
790200 | LID TRNASL 82 MUG 5Z BWL 10- 25 36.56 914.00
150CT
#79 | PLASTIC LID BOWL 907,
790300 | LID TRANSL BOWL SHRLNE 97 10- 25 36.56 914.00
100CT
#80 | CAN LINERS 40" X 46° RED
780014 | LINER CAN RED 40-45GAL 1.0MIL 150 36.47 5425.50
100BRYP
#31 | LATEX GLOVES LARGE
357390 | GLOVE VINYL LRG PWDFR 10-100 75 75.98 749.50




ITEM# | DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT COST | EXTENDED COST
#82 | LATEX GLOVES MEDIUM
397381 | GLOVE VINYL MED PWDFR 10-100 25 29.98 749.50
TOILEY PAPER HOLDERS
PAPER TOWEL HOLDERS
Lead Time A.R.O. Days
Grand Total for year one: $97,699.51

GRAND TOTAL FOR YEAR ONE INWRITTEN WORDS BELOW:

Ninety-Seven Thousand, Six Hundred, Ninety-nine dollars and fifty one cents.

Optional Year two (2) Percentage Increase

Optional Year three (3) Percentage Increase

Additional Percentage Discount if awarded in its entirety

- Tigned By:

/MW

re

ritle: fegima(. ,/ﬂyam;o =5 Develsger

Approved by:

KAREN SORBERO, SUNNY HILL NURSING HOME OF WILL COUNTY ADMINISTRATOR




Date Mailed: 10-19-09 COUNTY OF WILL CONTRACT FO

Due: 10-30-09. 11:00 A M. PURCHASING DEPARTMENT SHNH #2010-21 ,
Open: 10-30-09, 11:10 AM. 302 N. CHICAGO ST. MISC PAPER PRODUCT %E

JOLIET, IL. 60432
The Bidder proposes to provide the

{ products and/or services in accordance
NAME Edwafd b@ n_* OOWV“:/ with the specifications attached herein.
CONTACT FEIN.#_3U-208-[alY
appress 8500 S Havlem Ave
CITY MO('W\ QWQYS ldﬁ, STATE IL zip/ 06‘J(j Please check one:
EMAIL ba@h\/(;i/\ m @ don o) Minority Vendor. yes X no
pHoNeE_ 70%- 8§3- Q1002 FAX JO8E83-Slb02 .

THIS IS NOT AN ORDER

Agency Name and SUNNY HILL NURSING HONME OF WILL COUNTY,
Belivery Address: 421 DORIS AVEN(UE, JOLIET., IL 680433
For additional
information contact: RITA WEISS, PURCHASING rweiss@willcountyiilinois.com

YOU MUST LIST ON THE LINE BELOW EACH DESCRIPTION YOUR PRODUCT INFORMATION.
LE. Brand, Part #, Qity per Pkg and Case Count
Quantities are based on last year's usage and could vary depending on individual resident usage and facility census.
This bid may he awarded in whole or in part, by line item.

ITEM # | DESCRIPTION Qary UNIT COST | EXTENDED COST
#1 | TOILET PAPER 150 | 3180 718752
PN 3 TIPERS ande e
#2 | MULTIFOLD HAND TOWELS
mN?c%p g7 TRASXTETPh 5o | (599 7995%2
#3 | FACIAL TISSUES :
DoN o 2O e evbac |00 | 1825 1095
#4 | CAN LINERS 40" X 46” CLEAR LoD 10,25 270 90.50
Webskr Qigs4 Holly 100/cs | |
#5 | CAN LINERS 24" X 24" CLEAR 35D 11.%0 - Q950
Wdgekor JI594- Tod/cs |
#6 | CAN LINERS 30" X 47" CLEAR 2ol Mix A / A
WUoskr joofcs . _
#7 | CAN LINERS 24" X 33" RED ,
Wlosr Nk 5 */P‘r M'A' Nf{ﬁ
[ B
#38 | STYROFOAM DINNER PLATES 9" 2 1 1150 L, 2%
AR AR AL
#9 | STYROFOAM CAKE PLATES 6” e 12.50 29(,%
%P TW
bt o5 1660 22 gD

U T16%



ey

ITEM #

DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT COST | EXTENDED COST
#10 | CUTLERY SETS DISPOSABLE T 29,50 295 %.
' NHMZ{S0 PACAVE -
Do ysg‘)as PACRAVE FEFLSSN N D
#11 | DISPOSABLE FORKS MED WT 20 LSO Z04°0
M2360 Izai*‘?ﬁulgéa‘gw
#12 | DISPOSABLE SPOONS MED WT 26 (.50 204 %
2203 R3 ¥ 150072854
#13 | DISPOSABLE KNIVES MED WT 20 (.90 . [ 30%
M50 B35 7702199“5
(0o [e
#14 | DISPOSABLE SPOONS ICE TEA
A | A [k N [A
N
#15 | CLEAR DRINKWARE FLEXIBLE ¢ OZ | .50 V950
DN T00Z3AT DL hyF Ve Y
RE00pLY ¢
#16 | CLEAR DRINKWARE STRONG 9 OZ 4 750 20
DDN%”PBMQ Va (hv Pl
1000perease.
#17 | DISPOSABLE COFFEE MUGS 802 Nl N & N ] A
#18 | STYROFOAM CUPS 80Z I 14.50 7y e
“ToNF PSSR HES
#19 | STYROFOAM CUP LIDS 80Z 2 | 275 | 50
wYrTdT WL Kp# ALY :
PoN £ 1000/¢S 10w@Eg 1‘%0 i ;
#20 | STYROFOAM CUPS 1060Z 20| 1750 46550 %
""‘f 0% _
L Wt)imf_a\ -PQ%Hl
#21 | PAPERCUPS 507 4 1,50 |93(,%
Pl L3 8 1620107 ;
L%u?n%’hmvii?ﬂ int Z0pkg of-loo
#22 | DISPOSABLE DRINKING STRAWS e G550 5522
2 Valhiv #S
PEIZ) Vs Ko i T %oo/c,s
#23 | DISPOSABLE BOWLS 5 OZ 5 2915 U275 .
DZINES Wi'zx—'— Fv%mw FWB-5
#24 DISPOSABLE BOWL LIDS 155 Lo (%% auqop2-
o N¥E P : Vi DLS
Dmsmsi: %mﬁvﬁ% o
#25 LEB Z
Nk | NE W
N A
#26 | DISPOSABLE BOWLS 12 0Z ¢ 3,50 2g7%
DoV EPURTS PachyH FWHBAZ DO
200450

|00 RS



_mém # | DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT COST | EXTENDED COST
| #27 | DISPOSABLE TRAYS WHITE Lt 4, 50 | 1, 22
| DINECENG TG
Db 2 ‘%g?géctwwz 1
#28 | DISPOSABLE PAPER BAG #8 3] 5% 200 o0
DON B &P ¥ 18200034
319&1 u%%%gsé%?’
#29 | DISPOSABLE PAPER BAG #4 % @w 40%%.
2 | AA0D0 5 -
Sl
#30 - IS,
fal BN N
A
#31 | DISPOSABLE SILVERWARE BAG g < ED | 5302
D 5054 Q%;%ogy\caéd\ev ~
#32 | PLASTIC BAG 18" X 24" CLEAR 2 14.50 U .50
AL
DON 5%)343&:50&0003 Inandl
#33 | DISPOSABLE APRONS MED WT N I " Ul R ( x
N "
#34 | FOIL ROLL W/ICUTTER BOX 18’X1000° | D 3082 360%
BRI Novellis [STTEDN
#35 | FILM WRAP W/CUTTER BOX 18°X1000° |/ 1250 5022
DONFE BOI06 . Andhov [ 50 ZWgZ-
#36 | TABLECLOTH ROLL WHITE N } X N I A YA
NI | /
#37 | TABLECLOTH ROLL NAVY BLUE N
NI h N A
#38 TABLEyng;H ROLL PLUM
N | Wk s
N
#39 | TABLECLOTH ROLL HUNTER GREEN N ‘ A N NIk
N e !
#40 | TABLECLOTH ROLL PINE GREEN N N v ) A
‘ {
N A
#41 | TABLECLOTH ROLL MERLOT N A N y } i
' {
N A ‘
#42 | TABLECLOTH ROLL RED N V\ N A M I/A(
N ik ! '
#43 | TABLECLOTH ROLL CARIBBEAN BLUE NIAT W ’ N mn
N \A

iy4p S




l‘s'rém # | DESCRIPTION QTY | UNIT COST | EXTENDED COST
#44 | TABLECLOTHROLL ENGLISHROSE | pjlA | u Ii W [pe
N A, T U
#45 | TABLECLOTH ROLL ORANGE M M s W /k
NIk | |
#46 | TABLECLOTH ROLL YELLOW N /l I ,\[,ﬂ, 1 }A
! {
#47 TABLEG&)'{'ﬁ ROLL RED GINGHAM N /
e 1 A M
#48 | BEVERAGENAPKINS HUNTERGREEN | | 2. | 24 Q0 297 Un
DONFE PE“?O DHO%%W &fifcr 020w
#49 | BEVERAGE NAPKINS RED b | 2490 ¢ ¢p
DNEPBL & , oog%%smw 020341 -
#50 | BEVERAGE NAPKINS NAVY BLUE [é A Z0 1Ug.90
POVEPSY  Fophmasky e
#51 | BEVERAGE NAPKINS IVORY Y 2.Q0 [ Uy D
T TOWEP :5% . Dwy\mc{sw
#52 | BEVERAGE NAPKINS CLASSIC WHITE 7 1 3150 756D
DOW % P f’lf% 05 07 g;«tmasw 020120
#53 | BOUFFANT HAIR COVERING WHITE 0 43,750 37c%
o R O
VA Nk
N A
#55 | BUN RACK COVER 52" X 80"
DoN#%5 r3’5005 hjﬁnaqmms ROOTEG | 15| 1550 135.50-
#56 | DINNER NAPKINS NAVY BLUE |
DDW%WJ;LS{;%TC{%WMW 62058 1, 1 55.0%5 | 230.90
#57 | DINNER NAPKINS HUNTER GREEN |
PI%% HEE 5T 1L | 6515 Ll {-¢D
#58 | DINNER NAPKINS MERLOT
R B 5515 JALAS
#59 | DINNER NAPKINS RED ' 20 S5 105450 .
P1E*A HWQS};& fc’(f’ LUSTT
#60 | DINNER NAPKINS DELUXE IVORY 3y |55 lyHUED.
PISUL #* Dabsry |
lobo/¢s

dsSs U




[TEM# | DESCRIPTION QTY | UNITCOST | EXTENDED COST
#61 | PLACEMAT GOOD MORNING
Na | W & N [A
#62 | PLACEMAT TUSCANY
' N | Wk an
#63 | PLACEMAT COMBO HAPPY BIRTHDAY | iy | w4 v
1 1
#64 | PLACEMAT COMBO PATRIOTIC | N mre Iy, ]p(
I
#55 | PLACEMAT COMBO VALENTINE By
VAL N | Wik
#56 | PLACEMAT COMBO ST.PATRICKS | n/[4 | p/[4 mis
767 | PLACEMAT COMBO PACK EASTER |
Nk Nk | i
#68 | PLACEMAT COMBO FATHER'S DAY Nk M ’ n I, [ A
] i
#69 | PLACEMAT COMBO HALLOWEEN Nik | NVIA AN IA
#70 | PLACEMAT COMBO THANKSGIVING |/ ]a. | 4/ A
| | '
#71 | PLACEMAT COMBO NEW YEAR NIk vk J,
#72 | WIPES FOODSERVICE Nik | vIA N ﬁ
* )
#73 | TOWELETTE WET NAP
DONE Pgly  KaA DRWIOHRD | 75 | 250, | A50:
#74 | CANLINERS 24" X33 RED NVia | VI NI"™S
W[ ‘ |
#75 | BAG POLY, RECLOSEABLE o 225D 225%
Do PUTLI Jooir, 1o ~PPPO
#76 | MEDICINE GRAD CUP 10Z. 20 | 290 2SE
PHGY WINOAP VLTI an
#77 | PLACEMAT PAISLEY Vi | vla NI
I [ z
N

ot 3%




DESCRIPTION

lITEM # QTY UNIT COST | EXTENDED COST
#78 | PLASTIC LID MUG 80Z. e 3945 | 550 0
(anipy #LSMgBEA20 150/ CS
#78 | PLASTIC LID BOWL 90Z. 75 | 3115 | 00.05.
Coamtior O FCLSHAMD. I |
#80 | CAN LINERS 40” X 46" RED I50 }q LfD aq 10 8.
WAbsRY — JM135~ | A8](S - |
#81 | LATEX GLOVES LARGE
TP Imo LW ® 125 | Hogo | [p00%
#82 | LATEX GLOVES MEDIUM :
JE [meo Lglakey PE 2% | Uo.oo [000%
TOILET PAPER HOLDERS :
A
PAPER TOWEL HOLDERS
Lead Time A.R.O. Days
el
Grand Total for year one: |55, Ljg7 1) $

GRAND TOTAL FOR YEAR ONE IN WRITTEN WORDS BELOW:

Seventy Five Thowand Fouv fupndred NinedyTwo ¢ 700100 —

Optional Year two {2) Percentage increase

Optional Year three (3) Percentage Increase

| Additional Percentage Discount if awarded in its entirety

Signed By: <M f// S%Z%

Title:

A,

Approved by:

KAREN SORBERO, SUNNY HILL NURSING HOME OF WILL COUNTY ADMINISTRATOR

ot 7.5

.25



ITEM # DESCRIPTION GFS %w«Mﬁw M“nmm”._ ded LAPORT >”MW1M&MNMM& mC.WMM_Am s M“M- .Mq“”h.“ EDWARD DON MMWQ“«HHHN_Q
#1 TOLIET PAPER 38.75 31.76 32.96 31.50 $7,875.00
#2 MULTIFOLD HAND TOWELS 18.38 14.88 $7,490.00 15.06 15.99
#3 JFACIAL TISSUES 17.96 13.38 $802.80 18.88 18.25
#4 CAN LINERS 40” X 46” CLEAR - 100C 19.75 C 16.43 1316 C $18,284.00 19.35C
#5 CAN LINERS 24” X 24" CLEAR - 1000M 19.75 M 8.42 $2,355.00 12.00 M 11.80 M
#6 CAN LINERS 30" X 47" CLEAR - 100C 19.76C $1,143.75 16.76 14.60C
#7 CAN LINERS 24" X 33" CLEAR -1000M 19.96 M 15.98 $2,876.40 16.10 D (500)

#8 STYROFOAM DINNER PLATES 9 18.7¢ 12.98 $363.44 16.50

#9 STYROFOAM CAKE PLATES 6~ 18.76 12.10 $193.60 18.50

#10 CUTLERY SETS DISPOSABLE 39.75 10.63 $106.30 38.50

#11 DISPOSABLE FORKS MED WT 7.69 6.45 $193.50 6.80

#12 DISPOSABLE SPOCONS MED WT 7.68 6.45 $193.50 6.80

#13 DISPOSABLE KNIVES MED WT 7.69 6.45 $129.00 6.80

#14 DISPOSABLE SPOONS ICE TEA 21.75 $65.25

#15 FLEXIBLE PLASTIC GLASSES 9 OZ 63.95 69.50 $69.50
#16 STRONG PLASTIC GLASSES 8§ OZ 49.96 $299.76 76.50

#17 DISPOSABLE COFFEE MUGS 80Z 58.65 $703.80

#18 STYROFOAM CUPS 8 OZ 14.75 16.27 14.50 $174.001
#15 STYROFOAM CUP LIDS 8 OZ. 8.25 $99.00 13.24 8.75




#20 STYROFOAM CUPS 10 OZ 17.95 18.59 17. 50 $4,550.00
#21 PAPER CUPS 6 OZ 98.76 76.50 $1,836.00
#22 DISPOSABLE DRINKING STRAWS 83.40 36.30 $726.00 85.50

#23 DISPOSABLE BOWLS 5 02 23.10 16.97 $254 .55 28.25

#24 DISPOSABLE BOWL LIDS 13.75 $206.25 166.00

#25 DISPOSABLE BOWLS 8 OZ 26.96 $404.40 29.29

#26 DISPOSABLE BOWLS 12 OZ 32.95 $263.60 34.12 36.50

#27 DISPOSABLE TRAYS WHITE 76.56 46.50 $186.00
#28 DISPOSABLE PAPER BAG #8 81.76 50.00 $200.00
#29 DISPOSABLE PAPER BAG #4 107.45 68.00 $408.00
#30 [DISPOSABLE SANDWICH BAG 21.77 $130.62

#31 DISPOSABLE SILVERWARE BAG 2111 8.50 $153.00
#32 PLASTIC BAG 18” X 24” CLEAR 28.44 14.50 $43.50
#33 DISPOSABLE APRONS MED WT 16.93 $338.60 36.59

#34 FOIL ROLL WICUTTER BOX 18" X1000 17.66 $176.60 28.66 30.00

#35 FILM WRAP W/CUTTER BOX 18"X100¢° 17.95 15.32 12.50 $150.00
#36 TABLECLOTH ROLL WHITE 37.37 $186.85

#37 TABLECLOTH ROLL NAVY BLUE 37.73 $186.85

#38 TABLECLOTH ROLL PLUM NO BID

#39 TABLECLOTH ROLL HUNTER GREEN 37.37 $186.85




#40 TABLECLOTH ROLL PINE GREEN NO BID

#41 TABLECLOTH ROLL MERLOY NO BID

#42 TABLECLOTH ROLL RED 37.37 $186.85

#43 TABLECLOTH ROLL CARIBBEAN BLUE NO BID

#44 TABLECLOTH ROLL ENGLISH ROSE NG BID

#45 TABLECLOTH ROLL ORANGE NO BID

#46 TABLECLOTH ROLL YELLOW 37.37 $186.85

#47 TABLECLOTH ROLL RED GINGHAM 12.88 $257.60

#48 BEVERAGE NAPKINS HUNTER GREEN 13.86 $277.20 24.80
#49 BEVERAGE NAPKINS RED 13.86 $138.60 24.80
#50 BEVERAGE NAPKINS NAVY BLUE 13.86 $138.60 24.80
#51 BEVERAGE NAPKINS IVORY 13.86 $138.60 24.80
#52 BEVERAGE NAPKINS CLASSIC WHITE 13.86 37.50 $75.00
#53 BOUFFANT HAIR COVERING WHITE 60.55 20.90 $209.00 37.50
#54 COFFEE STIRRER 77 21.34 $213.40

#55 BUN RACK COVER 52” X 80" 23.60 13.50 $135.50
#56 DINNER NAPKINS NAVY BLUE 28.08 $280.80 55.15
#57 DINNER NAPKINS HUNTER GREEN 28.08 $561.60 55.15
#58 DINNER NAPKINS MERLOT 28.08 $702.004 55.15
#59 DINNER NAPKINS RED 28.08 $1,404.60 55.15
#60 DINNER NAPKINS DELUXE IVORY 28.08 $1,404.00 6§5.15




#61 DINNER NAPKINS GOOD MORNING 26.96 $1,348.00

#82 DINNER NAPKINS TUSCANY 32.42 $1,296.80

#63 DINNER NAPKINS HAPPY BIRTHDAY COMBO 28.19 $140.95

#64 DINNER NAPKINS PATRIOTIC COMBO 28.19 $84.57

#656 DINNER NAPKINS VALENTINE COMBO 28.19 $28.19

#66 DINNER NAPKINS ST. PATRICK'S COMBO 28.19 $28.18

#87 DINNER NAPKINS EASTER COMBO 28.1% $28.19

#68 DINNER NAPKINS FATHER'S DAY COMBO 28.19 $28.19

#69 DINNER NAPKINS HALLOWEEN COMBO 28.19 $28.19

#70 DINNER NAPKINS THANKSGIVING COMBO 26,71 $26.71

#71 DINNER NAPKINS NEW YEAR COMBO 28.19 $28.19

#72 DINNER NAPKINS WIPES 22.95 $573.75

#73 TOWELETTE WET NAP 12.87 12.50 $250.00
#74 CAN LINERS 24 X 33 RED - 250/CS £2.78 /500 16.10 /500 $805.00

#75 BAG - POLY RECLOSABLE 1 GAL 14.80 $148.00 22.50

#76 MEDICINE GRAD CUP - 1 OZ 33.76 31.80 $638.00
#17 PLACEMAT - PAISLEY 33.64 $841.00

#78 CAMBRO MUG LID - SHORELINE 8 OZ 36.56 $914.00 38.45

#79 CAMBRO SOUP BOWL LID - SHORELINE 9 OZ 36.56 32.25 $806.25
#30 CAN LINERS 40 X 46 RED - 125/CS 36.17C 16.00 /125 $2,400.00 18.40 /125




#81 LATEX FGOD HANDLING GLOVES - LARGE, 29.98 $749.50 32.00 40.00
#82 HATEX FOOD HANDLING GLOVES - MEDIUM, 29.98 $749.50 32.00 40.00
#83 TOILET PAPER HOLDER 13.00
#84 JPAPER TOWL HOLDER 19.00
X - s
total: &.m T .W M.WWMW@I% Wm
2nd yr increse $1,112.52 $1,504.2
2nd yr total $17,005.61 $22,093.23
3rd yr increase $1,190.38 $1,609.53
$18,196.00 $24,602.76

3rd yr total



